
 

 
Monday, March 21, 2022 
 
6:30 p.m. Executive Session 
7:00 p.m. Regular Meeting 

 

Agenda 
 

1. Call to Order 
 
 

2. Pledge of Allegiance 
 

3. Chair Comments 
 

A. Executive Session 
B. Employee Service Awards 

i. Officer Rich Michie – 30 Years  
ii. Officer Shawn Maguire – 10 Years 
iii. Assistant Manager Michael Walsh – 5 Years 

 
4. Public Comment 

 
5. Action Items 

 
A. Motion to approve meeting minutes of the Board of Supervisors meeting 

 
B. Motion to approve schedule of bills 

 
C. Motion to approve consent agenda 

i. Execution of the Record Plans for Naplin One Limited Partnership in reference to, 
4373 County Line Road, TMP #26‐005‐002‐004. They have executed all required 
documents, paid all fees, and posted the appropriate financial security. 

 
D. Motion to adopt Resolution #2022‐06: Budget Amendment Fund Transfers 

 
E. Motion to adopt Resolution #2022‐07: 409 W Butler Avenue Prelim/Final Approval 

 
F. Motion to award the Bucks County Consortium Materials Bid 

 
G. Motion to award the sale of a 2011 Ford Crown Victoria 

 
H. Motion to approve the Township’s appointed auditor to perform Federal single‐audit 

 
I. Motion to advertise Ordinance #2022‐04‐01: Adoption of 2018 Edition IPMC 

 
J. Motion to advertise Ordinance #2022‐04‐02: Adoption of 2018 Edition IFC 

 
K. Motion to adopt Resolution #2022‐08: Police Department Record Dissolution 

 



2 
2022_0321_NBT_BOS_BusMtg_Agenda – Business Meeting – March 21, 2022 

L. Motion to approve special event at N Branch Park 
 

6. Information Items 
 

A. Township Manager’s report 
B. Departmental Reports 
C. Solicitor’s Report 
D. Engineer’s Report 
E. Board of Supervisors’ Comments 

 
7. Adjournment 

  
The Next Meeting of the Board of Supervisors of New Britain Township will take place on Monday, April 
4, 2022, 7:00 p.m. at the New Britain Township Building, 207 Park Avenue, Chalfont, PA.  Agenda and 
meeting materials are posted to the Township website prior to the meeting date at 
www.newbritaintownship.org. 



 
 

New Britain Township 
Bucks County, Pennsylvania 

 
In Appreciation and Recognition  

 
of  
 

C. Rich Michie 
 

For 
 

30 Years of Public Service 
March 9, 2022 

 
 

Loyalty and commitment form the basis of any 
 

successful relationship, whether it be family or 
 

business.  We feel that the “New Britain Township”  
 

is loyal and committed to making our 
 

township the best it can be, and you are a 
 

significant part of that commitment. 
 

Thank you for 30 years of dedicated service to  
 

Our residents and taxpayers. 
 

NEW BRITAIN TOWNSHIP BOARD OF SUPERVISORS 
 
 

______________________  ______________________ 
 
 
______________________  ______________________ 
 
 
   ______________________ 



 
 

New Britain Township 
Bucks County, Pennsylvania 

 
In Appreciation and Recognition  

 
of  
 

Shawn Maguire 
 

For 
 

10 Years of Public Service 
March 5, 2022 

 
 

Loyalty and commitment form the basis of any 
 

successful relationship, whether it be family or 
 

business.  We feel that the “New Britain Township”  
 

is loyal and committed to making our 
 

township the best it can be, and you are a 
 

significant part of that commitment. 
 

Thank you for 10 years of dedicated service to  
 

Our residents and taxpayers. 
 

NEW BRITAIN TOWNSHIP BOARD OF SUPERVISORS 
 
 

______________________  ______________________ 
 
 
______________________  ______________________ 
 
 
   ______________________ 



 
 

New Britain Township 
Bucks County, Pennsylvania 

 
In Appreciation and Recognition  

 
of  
 

Michael Walsh 
 

For 
 

5 Years of Public Service 
March 17, 2022 

 
 

Loyalty and commitment form the basis of any 
 

successful relationship, whether it be family or 
 

business.  We feel that the “New Britain Township”  
 

is loyal and committed to making our 
 

township the best it can be, and you are a 
 

significant part of that commitment. 
 

Thank you for 5 years of dedicated service to  
 

Our residents and taxpayers. 
 

NEW BRITAIN TOWNSHIP BOARD OF SUPERVISORS 
 
 

______________________  ______________________ 
 
 
______________________  ______________________ 
 
 
   ______________________ 



 

 

 
MOTION A 

 
 
 

 
 

TOWNSHIP OF NEW BRITAIN 
BUCKS COUNTY, PA 

 
BOARD MOTION 

 
 
 
Date: March 21, 2022 
 
 
I MOVE THAT: The Board approve the minutes of the February 28, 2022 Business Meeting and the 
March 7, 2022 Workshop Meeting of the New Britain Township Board of Supervisors. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Presented By: __________________________________ 
 
 
Seconded By: __________________________________ 

 



 

 

 
MOTION B 

 
 
 

 
 

TOWNSHIP OF NEW BRITAIN 
BUCKS COUNTY, PA 

 
BOARD MOTION 

 
 
 
Date: March 21, 2022 
 
 
I MOVE THAT: The Board approve the Schedule of Bills dated March 2, 2022, March 11, 2022, March 
11, 2022 (medical reimbursements), and March 15, 2022, in the amount of $301,841.33, and authorize 
the Township Manager to pay all bills, per the attachment. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Presented By: __________________________________ 
 
 
Seconded By: __________________________________ 

 















EXPENDITURES PREVIEW 
APPROVAL 

NBT BOARD OF SUPERVISORS 

APPROVED BY THE BOARD OF 
SUPERVISORS 

_____________________________________

_____________________________________

_____________________________________

Attest: __________________________

Date:  __________________________



 

 

 
MOTION C 

 
 
 

 
 

TOWNSHIP OF NEW BRITAIN 
BUCKS COUNTY, PA 

 
BOARD MOTION 

 
 
 
Date: March 21, 2022 
 
 
I MOVE THAT: The Board approve all items on the consent agenda, dated March 21, 2022, per the 
attachment. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Presented By: __________________________________ 
 
 
Seconded By: __________________________________ 

 



Consent Agenda Items for the Next Meeting (03/21/2022) 
 

1. Execution of the Record Plans for Naplin One Limited Partnership in reference to, 4373 
County Line Road, TMP #26-005-002-004. They have executed all required documents, 
paid all fees, and posted the appropriate financial security. 
 
 
 















 

 

 
MOTION D 

 
 
 

 
 

TOWNSHIP OF NEW BRITAIN 
BUCKS COUNTY, PA 

 
BOARD MOTION 

 
 
 
Date: March 21, 2022 
 
 
I MOVE THAT: The Board adopt Resolution #2022‐06: Budget Amendment Fund Transfers, per the 
attachments. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Presented By: __________________________________ 
 
 
Seconded By: __________________________________ 

 



 

 

 

 

TO:   Board of Supervisors 

CC:   Matt West 

FROM:  John Bates     

DATE:  March 10, 2022 

RE:  Fund Transfer 

 

 
Hello all, 
 
This memo is requesting approval to transfer the following funds: 
 

1) Transfer $500,000.00  from  the General  Fund Operating Account  (01‐106‐000)  to  the General 
Reserve Fund Account (15‐106‐300) for future reserves 

 
2) Transfer $100,000.00 from the Parks & Recreation Fund Operating Account (07‐106‐000) to the 

Parks  &  Recreation  Capital  Account  (07‐102‐501)  to  be  used  for  future  Park  &  Recreation 
investment opportunities 
 

Based upon a periodic review of the New Britain Township budget, which examines the need for projected 
revenues and expenses, Township staff recommends that the aforementioned transfers be made as we 
continually monitor the budget to accurately reflect the Township’s monetary requirements. 
 
Thank you, 
 
John Bates 
Finance Director 



Resolution 2022-06 

NEW BRITAIN TOWNSHIP, BUCKS COUNTY, PENNSYLVANIA 

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF NEW BRITAIN TOWNSHIP  
FORMALLY AMENDING THE F.Y 2022 BUDGET 

 
WHEREAS, it is prudent and sound fiscal management to periodically conduct a review of the New Britain 
Township budget; and 
 
WHEREAS, the review provides an opportunity to examine projected revenues and expenses; and 
 
WHEREAS, the review was conducted and it is recommended the following budget adjustments and/or 
amendments are proposed to reflect changes in fiscal management: 
 

Reduce the amount of $500,000.00 from Account #01.106.000 General Fund Savings; and  
Increase the amount of $500,000.00 to Account #15.106.300 General Reserve Savings for future reserve. 
 
Reduce the amount of $100,000.00 from Account #07.106.000 Park & Recreation Fund Savings; and  
Increase the amount of $100,000.00 to Account #07.102.501 Park & Recreation Capital for future Park & 
Recreation investments. 

 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, this 21st day of March, 2022, by the New Britain Township Board of 
Supervisors that the Treasurer is authorized and directed to make the afore referenced Budget adjustments. 
 
NEW BRITAIN TOWNSHIP BOARD OF SUPERVISORS 
 
________________________________    
Gregory T. Hood, Chair     
 
________________________________    
William B. Jones, III, Vice Chair       
 
________________________________   ________________________________ 
Cynthia M. Jones      Matt West, Township Manager 

 
________________________________        
MaryBeth McCabe, Esq.  
 
________________________________   
Stephanie M. Shortall 



 

 

 
MOTION E 

 
 
 

 
 

TOWNSHIP OF NEW BRITAIN 
BUCKS COUNTY, PA 

 
BOARD MOTION 

 
 
 
Date: March 21, 2022 
 
 
I MOVE THAT: The Board adopt Resolution 2022‐07: 409 W Butler Avenue Prelim/Final Approval, per 
the attachment. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Presented By: __________________________________ 
 
 
Seconded By: __________________________________ 

 



 

{00974867/} 1 
 

RESOLUTION NO.  2022-07 
 

NEW BRITAIN TOWNSHIP 
BUCKS COUNTY, PENNSYLVANIA 

 
 

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF NEW BRITAIN 
TOWNSHIP GRANTING PRELIMINARY/FINAL LAND DEVELOPMENT 
APPROVAL TO BUTLER PIKE PROPERTIES, LP, FOR THE LAND 
DEVELOPMENT PLANS FOR BUTLER PIKE PROPERTIES, LP, PREPARED 
BY HOLMES CUNNINGHAM, LLC, DATED NOVEMBER 30, 2021, 
CONSISTING OF 21 SHEETS, WHICH PROPOSE THE CONSTRUCTION OF 
TWO BUILDINGS FOR RESIDENTIAL AND COMMERCIAL PURPOSES. 

 
 

WHEREAS, Butler Pike Properties, L.P. (the “Applicant”) has submitted an application 
for preliminary/final plan land development approval of a mixed-use land development that 
proposes the construction of two (2) buildings on a vacant lot (the “Project”), consisting of 7.27 
acres, located on West Butler Avenue and denoted as Bucks County Tax Map Parcel #26-005-023 
(the “Property”); and 
 

WHEREAS, the proposal is reflected on a plan entitled “Land Development Application 
for Butler Pike Properties, LP”, prepared by Holmes Cunningham, LLC, dated November 30, 
2021, consisting of 21 sheets (the “Plan”); and 
 

WHEREAS, the New Britain Township Planning Commission reviewed the Plan at its 
February 22, 2022, meeting, and found the Plan to be in substantial compliance with the provisions 
of the Settlement Stipulation and Agreement approved by the Honorable Wallace H. Bateman, Jr., 
President Judge of the Court of Common Pleas of Bucks County, at Docket No. 2021-00629, on 
October 21, 2021.   
 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ADOPTED AND RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors 
of New Britain Township hereby grants preliminary/final plan approval to the Project subject to 
Applicant’s compliance with the following conditions: 
 

1. Applicant shall comply with all recommendations of the Gilmore and Associates 
Review Letter dated January 19, 2022, unless herein modified.  A true and correct 
copy of this letter is attached hereto and incorporated herein as Exhibit “A.”  
(Township Code §22-403, §22-502) 

 
2. Applicant shall comply with all recommendations of the Bucks County Planning 

Commission Review Letter dated January 18, 2022, except with regard to comment 
number 3.  A true and correct copy of this letter is attached hereto and incorporated 
herein as Exhibit “B.”  (Township Code §22-403, §22-502) 

 



 

{00974867/} 2 
 

3. Applicant shall comply with all recommendations of the New Britain Township 
Fire Marshal review letter dated January 11, 2022, unless herein modified.  A true 
and correct copy of this letter is attached hereto and incorporated herein as Exhibit 
“C.”  (Township Code §22-403, §22-502) 

 
4. Applicant shall comply with the Settlement Stipulation and Agreement noted 

previously in this Resolution, which was approved by Order of Judge Wallach H. 
Bateman, Jr., President Judge, on October 21, 2021.  A true and correct copy of the 
Settlement Stipulation and Agreement is attached hereto and incorporated herein as 
Exhibit “D.”  
 

5. If applicable, Applicant shall provide natural resource protection easements across 
the Property in accordance with the Township Zoning Ordinance.  (Township Code 
§27-502.3, §27-505 & §27-2401.c) 

 
6. Applicant shall construct all public improvements shown on the Plan at its sole cost 

and expense, including but not limited to, water and sewer facilities, stormwater 
facilities, street trees, roadway widening, installation of curbs and sidewalks, and 
roadway milling and overlay; or to the extent said improvements are referenced in the 
Settlement Stipulation and Agreement referenced previously. 

 
7. Although noted in the Settlement Stipulation and Agreement, Applicant shall 

contribute to the Township the sum of $185,000.00 as a fee in lieu of the required 
park and recreation improvements, with the understanding that (a) fifty percent 
(50%) of the total sum or $92,500.00 shall be payable upon recording the final land 
development Plan; and (b) the balance of $92,500.00 shall be payable upon 
issuance of the first occupancy permit for either building on the property.  
(Township Code §22-715) 

 
8. Applicant shall execute the required Stormwater Maintenance Agreement in a form 

approved by the Township Solicitor.  Applicant shall pay the required stormwater 
fee of $1,522.50 ($2.50 per linear foot of existing and proposed roads within the 
development) contemporaneously with execution of Development Agreements.  
(Township Code §22-712.13, §§26-151 - 164; Township Fee Resolution No. 2021-
3) 

 
9. Applicant shall pay the Stormwater BMP Maintenance Guarantee fee applied to all 

proposed BMPs installed within the Township for the timely installation, proper 
construction, and continued maintenance of such facilities by the owner of the 
subject property.  The fee is 5% of the construction costs of all the BMPs proposed 
as a part of the Project, with a minimum fee of $100.00, but not to exceed 
$10,000.00.  This fee will be determined by the Township Engineer once 
Applicant’s Opinion of Probable Cost is reviewed and approved by the Township 
Engineer.  (Township Code §22-712.13, §§26-151 - 164; Township Fee Resolution 
No. 2021-3) 

 



 

{00974867/} 3 
 

10. Applicant shall obtain all required approvals from various agencies having 
jurisdiction over the Project, including, but not limited to:  Pennsylvania 
Department of Environmental Protection (“DEP”) NPDES Permit, DEP Sewage 
Facilities Planning Module, Bucks County Health Department, Bucks County 
Conservation District E & S Permit, and Pennsylvania Department of 
Transportation Highway Occupancy Permit.  (Township Code §22-406.1, §22-711, 
§22-720, §22-721, §22-905) 

 
11. Prior to recording of Final Plans, if applicable, Applicant shall submit any 

condominium documents in a form approved by the Township Solicitor.  
(Township Code §22-406.1, §27-2703) 

 
12. Applicant shall submit to the Township Engineer for review all necessary legal 

descriptions and construction cost estimates of the site improvements.  (Township 
Code §22-406.1, §22-903, §22-904) 

 
13. Applicant shall execute Development and Financial Security Agreements and all 

other development documents (including all necessary guarantees, agreements, 
easements, deeds, and declarations), all in a form and manner to be approved by 
the Township Solicitor; Applicant shall post sufficient financial security in a form 
acceptable to the Township; Applicant shall provide proof of sufficient insurance 
coverage to the Township.  (Township Code §22-406.1) 

 
14. Applicant shall execute all deeds of dedication, legal descriptions of rights-of-way, 

access easement descriptions, lot descriptions, notes, etc., all in a form and manner 
to be approved by the Township Solicitor.  Descriptions for those areas of land 
specified on the Plans for dedication to the Township shall be submitted to the 
Township Engineer in a form suitable to the Engineer.  These deeds shall be 
accompanied by title insurance to the benefit of the Township indicating that title 
to these areas is free and clear of all liens, encumbrances and restrictions that could 
adversely affect the use of these dedicated for roadways and other proper purposes.  
(Township Code §22-406.1) 

 
15. Applicant shall pay all appropriate fees applicable to this Project including all 

outstanding bills from the Township’s professional consultants.  (Township Code 
§22-406.1) 

 
16. All documentation shall be executed prior to recording of Record Plans.  (Township 

Code §22-406) 
 

17. Applicant and its professionals shall execute, notarize, and seal the Final Record 
Plan.  (Township Code §22-406.2) 

 
18. Applicant shall comply with all other applicable Township, County, State, and 

Federal rules, regulations, codes, ordinances, and statutes, except to the extent any 



 

{00974867/} 4 
 

Township rules, regulations, codes, or ordinances are modified in accordance with 
the terms of the Settlement Stipulation and Agreement.  (Township Code §22-905) 
 

20. Plans and project shall be ADA compliant. 
 
21. A screen shall be constructed as an evergreen screen planted between the rear of 

the Property and the adjoining residential properties, which said evergreen screen 
shall be subject to the approval of the Township Engineer. 

 
22. Applicant shall provide a Plan showing the off-site stormwater improvements 

proposed to be constructed by the Applicant, which shall meet the approval of the 
Township Engineer. 

 
23. No trees shall be removed to facilitate construction of the trail to the rear of the 

property behind the parking lot, unless otherwise approved by the Township 
Engineer. 

 
24. If the Township receives any complaints regarding lighting or sound after 

construction is completed, the Applicant shall adjust any lighting or buffering as 
recommended by the Township Engineer. 

 
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, in response to Applicant’s written request, the Board of 

Supervisors hereby grants waivers to the following sections of Chapter 22 of the Township Code 
(Subdivision and Land Development).  The grant of these waivers is conditioned upon the 
Applicant meeting the following requirements, where noted: 

 
a. Section 22-202 – From providing a Community Impact Assessment Report. 
 
b. Section 22-705.3 – From undertaking roadway widening and associated 

improvements along the Butler Avenue frontage, subject to such improvements as 
may be required under the jurisdiction of the Pennsylvania Department of 
Transportation. 

 
c. Section 22-713.5.B(6) – From providing berm and screen plantings for a B7 

Apartment Use, as to the Butler Avenue frontage only. 
 
d. Section 22-715 – From providing park and recreation land. 
 
e. Section 22-722 – From compliance with  the Butler Avenue Overlay requirements 

other than those specifically required in paragraph 9 of the Settlement Stipulation 
and Agreement, or as shown on the Settlement Plan attached as Exhibit “A” to the 
Settlement Stipulation and Agreement. 

 
f. Section 22-711.4(c) – To permit grading within five (5) feet of the property line. 
 
 



 

{00974867/} 5 
 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that Applicant shall make the following off-site 
improvements: 

 
a. Installation of a variable width (4 to 5 foot) sidewalk in compliance with Township 

and PennDOT standards along the frontage of Butler Avenue from the northern 
property line of the Property to the connection with existing sidewalk, including 
requisite ADA compliant ramps, generally as depicted on the Settlement Plan 
attached as Exhibit “A” to the Settlement Stipulation and Agreement. 

 
b. Installation of a variable width (4 to 5 foot) sidewalk in compliance with Township 

and PennDOT standards along the frontage of Butler Avenue from the southern 
property line of the Property to the connection with existing sidewalk, including 
requisite ADA compliant ramps, generally as depicted on the Settlement Plan 
attached as Exhibit “A” to the Settlement Stipulation and Agreement. 

 
BE IT FINALLY RESOLVED, that the conditions of approval have been made known 

to Applicant, and this preliminary/final plan approval is to be deemed expressly contingent upon 
Applicant’s affirmative written acceptance of the said conditions on a form prescribed by the 
Township within 30 days of the approval of this Resolution.  If an unconditional acceptance of the 
conditions is not received in writing by that date, the application for preliminary/final plan 
approval shall be deemed denied based upon Applicant’s failure to agree to and/or fulfill the said 
conditions. 

 
 
 
 
 
 

[THIS SPACE INTENTIONALLY BLANK. SIGNATURE PAGE FOLLOWS.]  



 

{00974867/} 6 
 

NEW BRITAIN TOWNSHIP 
BUCKS COUNTY, PENNSYLVANIA 

RESOLUTION NO.  2022-07 
 
 

DULY ADOPTED this ____ day of ____________, 2022, by the Board of Supervisors of 
New Britain Township, in lawful session duly assembled. 
 
 
ATTEST:       
 
 
              
Matthew West, Township Manager   Gregory T. Hood, Chairman 
 
 
              
       William B. Jones, III, Vice Chairman 
 
 
              

Cynthia M. Jones, Member 
 
 

              
MaryBeth McCabe, Esquire, Member 
 
 

       
 Stephanie Shortall, Member 
 
 















































































 

 

 
MOTION F 

 
 
 

 
 

TOWNSHIP OF NEW BRITAIN 
BUCKS COUNTY, PA 

 
BOARD MOTION 

 
 
 
Date: March 21, 2022 
 
 
I MOVE THAT: The Board award the 2022‐2023 Bucks County Consortium Materials Bid, per the 
attachments. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Presented By: __________________________________ 
 
 
Seconded By: __________________________________ 

 



 

TO:  Board of Supervisors 

FROM: Ryan Cressman, Superintendent of Public Works 

DATE: March 2, 2022 

RE: Bucks County Consortium Materials Bid Award 

 

 
The Bucks County Consortium (BCC) jointly bids several commodities used by municipalities & 
authorities throughout Bucks County, which are critical to our annual operations. New Britain 
Township participates in these joint bids to benefit from the combined purchasing power of the 
BCC to obtain competitive prices for fuel, salt, blacktop, stone, and other materials.  
 
On Friday, February 25, 2022, at 9:30 A.M., the bids were opened for the 2022- 2023 Bucks 
County Consortium Materials Bid hosted by New Britain Township. Due to Covid-19 and other 
supply chain issues, the cost of all materials will be increased in 2022. After reviewing all bids, 
staff recommends that the Board of Supervisors reward the bid. 
 
Staff Recommendation: 
 
Staff recommends the Board of Supervisors award the bid to Eureka Stone Quarry for blacktop 
at $54.94 per ton as they were the lowest qualified bidder. This represents a $7.45 per ton 
increase in costs from 2021.  
 
Staff recommends the Board of Supervisors award the bid to Naceville Materials, J.V. Chalfont 
Quarry & Asphalt for stone as they were the lowest qualified bidder. 
   



Material Unit Quantity Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
FOB Plant Delivered FOB Plant Delivered FOB Plant Delivered FOB Plant Delivered FOB Plant Delivered FOB Plant Delivered FOB Plant Delivered

Screening/Quarry Grit tons 1,600 -$              -$              9.40$           Haul Rates 9.75$           Haul Rates 10.55$         Haul Rates -$              -$              -$              -$              9.40$           Haul Rates
1/4" Stone Chips (AS1) tons 2,330 -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
1B 3/4" Stone tons 3,260 -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
1B 3/8" Stone tons 500 -$              -$              -$              -$              26.00$         Haul Rates 20.50$         Haul Rates -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
1B 1/2" Stone tons 750 -$              -$              -$              -$              26.00$         Haul Rates 20.50$         Haul Rates -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
1B Stone #8 Wash tons 100 -$              -$              20.00$         Haul Rates -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              20.00$         Haul Rates
N. 2 3/4" Stone tons 3,945 -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
No. 2B 3/4" Stone tons 5,605 -$              -$              14.50$         Haul Rates 18.00$         Haul Rates 17.65$         Haul Rates -$              -$              -$              -$              14.50$         Haul Rates
No. 3A 1 1/2" Stone tons 750 -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              17.65$         Haul Rates -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
No. 4 Stone Ballast tons 2,990 -$              -$              13.50$         Haul Rates -$              17.65$         Haul Rates -$              -$              -$              -$              13.50$         Haul Rates
No. 5 Stone/anti-skid tons 150 -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
No. 6S Stone/anti-skid (AS2 or AS4) tons 200 -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              16.85$         Haul Rates -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
No. 2A Stone mix tons 12,100 -$              -$              10.00$         Haul Rates 10.75$         Haul Rates 13.00$         Haul Rates -$              -$              -$              -$              10.00$         Haul Rates
3/4" stone mix tons 2,240 -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              13.00$         Haul Rates -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
5-8" mix gabion stone tons 1,480 -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              18.40$         Haul Rates -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
Rip-Rap mixed stone tons 2,070 -$              -$              15.00$         Haul Rates -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              15.00$         Haul Rates
R-4 Stone tons 2,290 -$              -$              25.00$         Haul Rates -$              -$              18.40$         Haul Rates -$              -$              -$              -$              25.00$         Haul Rates
R-5 Stone tons 110 -$              -$              28.00$         Haul Rates -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              28.00$         Haul Rates
R-6 Stone tons 100 -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
ID2 1/4" asphalt (top) tons 0 -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
ID2 1/2" asphalt (top) tons 0 -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
ID2 3/4" asphalt (base) tons 500 -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
ID-3 Airport Mix tons 500 -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
HE-ID2 SRLH 3/4" (top) tons 0 -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
HE-ID2 SRLH 1/2" (top) tons 0 -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
FB3 Blacktop (Base) tons 500 -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
BCBC Blacktop (Base) tons 500 -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
PSP cold patching material tons 3,380 -$              -$              -$              -$              106.00$       Haul Rates 135.00$       Haul Rates 132.00$       132.00$       -$              -$              -$              -$              
Super Pave 9.5 mm Wearing tons 24,065 -$              -$              -$              -$              54.94$         Haul Rates 58.50$         Haul Rates -$              -$              56.00$         Haul Rates -$              -$              
Super Pave 12.5 mm Wearing tons 2,900 -$              -$              -$              -$              59.94$         Haul Rates -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
Super Pave 19.0 mm Wearing tons 1,695 -$              -$              -$              -$              50.19$         Haul Rates 53.09$         Haul Rates -$              -$              51.50$         Haul Rates -$              -$              
Super Pave 19.0 mm Binder tons 4,930 -$              -$              -$              -$              50.19$         Haul Rates 53.09$         Haul Rates -$              -$              51.50$         Haul Rates -$              -$              
Super Pave 25.0 mm Binder tons 3,645 -$              -$              -$              -$              46.34$         Haul Rates 50.00$         Haul Rates -$              -$              47.50$         Haul Rates -$              -$              
Super Pave 25.0 mm Base tons 980 -$              -$              -$              -$              46.34$         Haul Rates 50.00$         Haul Rates -$              -$              47.50$         Haul Rates -$              -$              
Super Pave 37.5 mm Base tons 80 -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
Koch 9005 Crack Sealer/Elastoflex 61 pounds 1,035 1.14$           1.39$           -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
Koch 9075-r Flex-a-fill/Elastoflex-650 pounds 1,000 1.09$           1.34$           -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
Bar Sand tons 105 -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              30.00$         Haul Rates -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
Concrete Sand 1/4" tons 0 -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
AC-20 Asphalt Crack Sealer/AC-20/PG64-22 gallons/lbs. 105 -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
AC-2000 Liquid Asphalt gallons 50 -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
Screened Top Soil tons 435 -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
Dirt Fill/Borrow tons 25 -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
486 Cold Patch mix w/ fiber/Zero VOC Bulk Cold Patch tons 2,085 -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
HEC-Concrete 3500 Mix yards 2,040 -$              -$              -$              -$              110.00$       Haul Rates -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
Crafco Poliflex II Crack Seal/Elastoflex-650 pounds 41,000 0.89$           0.99$           -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
Detack gallons 125 22.00$         32.00$         -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
Tack Coat/CSS-1 Water Based Tack Coat gallons 175 5.00$           8.75$           -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
QPR Cold Patch tons 410 -$              -$              130.00$       Haul Rates -$              -$              -$              -$              132.00$       132.00$       -$              -$              -$              -$              
DSA (Driving Superior Aggregate) tons 500 -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
Crackmaster 3405 pounds 9,000 0.85$           0.95$           -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              
High Performance Patch tons 100 -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              132.00$       132.00$       -$              -$              -$              -$              

Hei-way, LLC Miller Materials

ALL HAULING RATES 
ATTACHED & SEE SCHED. OF 
PRICES FOR REMARKS FROM 

BIDDER

NOTE(S) ABOUT BIDS

Plumstead Materials

Bucks Consortium Road Materials Bid
February 25, 2022 Materials Bid Opening

SEE SCHEDULE OF PRICES 
FOR REMARKS FROM BIDDER

ALL HAULING RATES ATTACHED 
& SEE SCHED. OF PRICES FOR 

REMARKS FROM BIDDER

ALL HAULING RATES ATTACHED 
& SEE SCHED. OF PRICES FOR 

REMARKS FROM BIDDER

ALL HAULING RATES ATTACHED 
& SEE SCHED. OF PRICES FOR 

REMARKS FROM BIDDER

SEE SCHEDULE OF PRICES 
FOR REMARKS FROM BIDDER

ALL HAULING RATES ATTACHED 
& SEE SCHED. OF PRICES FOR 

REMARKS FROM BIDDER

Asphalt Maintenance 
Solutions, LLC Chalfont Materials Eureka Stone Quarry, Inc.

Hanson Aggregates BMC 
Inc.



 

 

 
MOTION G 

 
 
 

 
 

TOWNSHIP OF NEW BRITAIN 
BUCKS COUNTY, PA 

 
BOARD MOTION 

 
 
 
Date: March 21, 2022 
 
 
I MOVE THAT: The Board award the sale of the 2011 Ford Crown Victoria, per the attachments. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Presented By: __________________________________ 
 
 
Seconded By: __________________________________ 

 



 

TO:  Board of Supervisors 

FROM: Michael Walsh, Assistant Township Manager 

DATE: March 4, 2022 

RE: 2011 Ford Crown Victoria – Sale of Township Property 

 

 
On February 14, 2022, New Britain Township staff listed a 2011 Ford Crown Victoria for sale at 
a public auction on Municibid an online government auction site. Based on the Township’s 
vehicle replacement plan, the 2011 Ford Crown Victoria was removed from service. The 
anticipated return for this vehicle was estimated to be less than $2,000, based on the Kelly 
Blue Book and the car’s condition; however, when the auction ended on February 28, 2022, the 
item sold for $2,250.00. 
 
On November 15, 2021, the Board of Supervisors passed Resolution #2021-31: Sale of 
Township Property Policy. This resolution outlined policy and procedures for Township staff to 
properly sell or dispose of Township property. As part of this policy, the Board of Supervisors 
required any item valued over $2,000 receive Board approval before its sale or disposal. 
 
After publicly bidding the 2011 Ford Crown Victoria, the car’s value exceeds $2,000 and 
requires Board approval to sell the item to the highest bidder. 
 
Staff Recommendation: 
 
Staff recommends the Board of Supervisors authorize the 2011 Ford Crown Victoria sale to the 
highest bidder, Antonio Aspite, for $2,250.00. 
 
 



2011 Ford Crown Victoria
Seller: newbritaintown Listing # 41579530 Custom ID: Starting Bid: $500.00 HIGH BID: $2,250.00
Started: 2/14/2022 10:00:00 AM Ended: 2/28/2022 10:00:00 AM Number of Bids: 27 Number of Views: 1658 Reserve Price: $0

High Bidder: Antonio Aspite
Bidder Email: mail@aspiteauction.com Bidder Phone: 267-228-4703
Address: 7000 State rd , Philadelphia PA 19135

Bid History
Bid Date/Time Bid Username First Last Email Phone
2/28/2022 6:18:16 AM $2,250.00 aaa Antonio Aspite
2/25/2022 4:21:23 PM $2,200.00 tclarkauctioneer tumar Clark
2/25/2022 4:21:23 PM $2,150.00 dep jack boisvert
2/24/2022 9:08:46 AM $2,100.00 tclarkauctioneer tumar Clark
2/24/2022 9:08:46 AM $2,050.00 Gatortrucksales Brian Werner
2/23/2022 2:29:32 PM $2,000.00 tclarkauctioneer tumar Clark
2/23/2022 2:29:32 PM $1,950.00 Gatortrucksales Brian Werner
2/23/2022 2:29:13 PM $1,800.00 tclarkauctioneer tumar Clark
2/23/2022 2:29:13 PM $1,750.00 Gatortrucksales Brian Werner
2/23/2022 2:29:02 PM $1,550.00 tclarkauctioneer tumar Clark
2/23/2022 2:29:02 PM $1,500.00 Gatortrucksales Brian Werner
2/23/2022 1:52:34 PM $1,300.00 tclarkauctioneer tumar Clark
2/23/2022 1:52:34 PM $1,250.00 Gatortrucksales Brian Werner
2/15/2022 5:37:07 AM $1,050.00 Gatortrucksales Brian Werner
2/15/2022 5:37:07 AM $1,000.00 Giants181 Michael Guarraci
2/15/2022 5:36:55 AM $875.00 Gatortrucksales Brian Werner
2/15/2022 5:36:55 AM $850.00 Giants181 Michael Guarraci
2/14/2022 9:34:50 PM $775.00 Gatortrucksales Brian Werner
2/14/2022 9:34:50 PM $750.00 khachkar Karen Khachatryan
2/14/2022 1:43:36 PM $725.00 Gatortrucksales Brian Werner
2/14/2022 1:43:36 PM $700.00 khachkar Karen Khachatryan
2/14/2022 1:43:30 PM $625.00 Gatortrucksales Brian Werner
2/14/2022 1:43:30 PM $600.00 khachkar Karen Khachatryan
2/14/2022 1:43:22 PM $550.00 Gatortrucksales Brian Werner
2/14/2022 1:43:22 PM $525.00 khachkar Karen Khachatryan
2/14/2022 11:28:23 AM $500.00 Gatortrucksales Brian Werner



2/14/2022 11:28:54 AM $500.00 Gatortrucksales Brian Werner



 

 

 
MOTION H 

 
 
 

 
 

TOWNSHIP OF NEW BRITAIN 
BUCKS COUNTY, PA 

 
BOARD MOTION 

 
 
 
Date: March 21, 2022 
 
 
I MOVE THAT: The Board approve the Township’s auditor to preform Federal single‐audit, per the 
attachments. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Presented By: __________________________________ 
 
 
Seconded By: __________________________________ 

 

















 

 

 
MOTION I 

 
 
 

 
 

TOWNSHIP OF NEW BRITAIN 
BUCKS COUNTY, PA 

 
BOARD MOTION 

 
 
 
Date: March 21, 2022 
 
 
I MOVE THAT: The Board authorize advertisement of Ordinance #2022‐04‐01, per the attachments. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Presented By: __________________________________ 
 
 
Seconded By: __________________________________ 

 



{00974497/}  

I 

NEW BRITAIN TOWNSHIP 
Bucks County, Pennsylvania 

 
ORDINANCE #2022-04-01 

 
 
 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 5, PART 2 OF THE 
CODIFIED ORDINANCES OF NEW BRITAIN TOWNSHIP 
ADOPTING THE 2018 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL 
PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE AS THE TOWNSHIP'S 
PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE. 

 
 

WHEREAS, pursuant to Articles XV, XVIII, XXIII, XXIV, XXV, and XXVI of the 
Second-Class Township Code, including but not limited to Sections 66505, 66506, 66527, 
66517, 66529, 66704-A, 67101, and 67105, New Britain Township has the ability to govern the 
conditions and maintenance of all property, buildings, and structures within the Township; and 

 
WHEREAS, the New Britain Township Board of Supervisors desires to establish 

minimum regulations governing the conditions and maintenance of all property, buildings, and 
structures by providing the standards for supplied utilities and facilities and other physical things 
and conditions essential to ensure that structures are safe, sanitary, and fit for occupation and use; 
and  

 
WHEREAS, the Board of Supervisors does further desire to authorize the condemnation 

of buildings and structures unfit for human occupancy and use and the demolition of such 
structures.  

 
NOW, THEREFORE, it is hereby ENACTED and ORDAINED by the Board of 

Supervisors of New Britain Township, as follows: 
 
ARTICLE I Adoption and Codification of the Property Maintenance Code  
 

Section 5-201 of the Codified Ordinances of New Britain Township is hereby amended to 
read as follows:  
 
§5-201   Adoption of Standards. 
 
The 2018 International Property Maintenance Code, as published by the International Code 
Council, Inc., as amended, revised, and/or reprinted from time to time, is hereby adopted as the 
Property Maintenance Code of New Britain Township; for the control and maintenance of 
property, buildings, and structures as herein provided; and each and all of the regulations, 
provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said International Property Maintenance Code are 
hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this Chapter, with the 
additions, insertions, deletions, and changes as prescribed below in this Chapter.  



{00974497/} 2  

 
ARTICLE II Modification of International Property Maintenance Code Standards 
 

Section 5-202 of the Codified Ordinances of New Britain Township is hereby amended to 
read as follows:  
 
§5-202   Revisions to Standards.  
 
The following replacements, insertions, and modifications shall be made in the 2018 
International Property Maintenance Code at the places hereinafter indicated:  
 
A. Subsection 101.1 Title: (page 1) 
 

Replace "[NAME OF JURISDICTION]" with "New Britain Township". 
 
B. Subsection 102.3 Application of other codes: (page 1)  
 

Modify to read as follows: "Repairs, additions or alterations to a structure, or changes of 
occupancy, shall be done in accordance with the procedures and provisions of the 
Pennsylvania Uniform Construction Code ("UCC"), as adopted by New Britain 
Township. Where the UCC does not apply, the International Building Code, International 
Existing Building Code, International Energy Conservation Code, International Fire 
Code, International Fuel Gas Code, International Mechanical Code, International 
Residential Code, International Plumbing Code and NFPA 70 shall be followed when 
making repairs, additions or alterations to a structure, or changes of occupancy. Nothing 
in this code shall be construed to cancel, modify, or set aside any provision of Chapter 27 
- the New Britain Township Zoning Ordinance." 

 
C. Subsection 103.5 Fees: (page 2) 
 

Modify to read as follows: "The fees for activities and services performed by the 
Township in carrying out its responsibilities under this code shall be set by resolution of 
the Board of Supervisors of New Britain Township." 

 
D. Subsection 104.3 Right of entry: (page 2) 
 

Modify the last sentence to read as follows: "If entry is refused, the code official is 
authorized to seek an administrative warrant to secure entry." 

 
E. Subsection 106.3 Prosecution of violation: (page 3) 
 

Modify to read as follows: "Any person failing to comply with a notice of violation or 
order served in accordance with Section 107 shall be deemed in violation of this case, and 
this violation shall be considered a strict liability offense. If the notice or order is not 
complied with, the Township may institute the appropriate proceeding at law or in equity 
to restrain, correct, or abate such violation; to impose fines and penalties for such 



{00974497/} 3  

violation; and/or to require the removal or termination of the unlawful occupancy of the 
structure or property in violation of the provisions of this code or of the order or direction 
made pursuant thereto.   Any action taken by the Township shall be charged against the 
real estate upon which the violation is located and shall be a lien upon such real estate." 

 
F. Subsection 106.4 Violation penalties: (page 3) 
 

Modify to read as follows: "Any person who is found. by a court of competent 
jurisdiction, including but not limited to a Magisterial District Court or Court of Common 
Pleas, to have violated a provision of this code; to have failed to comply with any of the 
requirements of this code; or to have failed to comply with an order, directive, or notice 
of the code official concerning this code shall be liable for a civil penalty not less than 
Two Hundred Dollars ($200.00) or more than One Thousand Dollars ($1,000.00) for each 
violation, plus any and all costs incurred by the Township in bringing an action against 
such violation, including but not limited to consultant fees, attorney's fees, and expert 
witness fees. Each day that a violation continues shall be deemed a separate violation." 

 
G. Subsection 107.1 Notice to person responsible: (page 3) 
 

Modify to read as follows: "Whenever the code official determines that there has been a . 
violation of this code or has grounds to believe that a violation has occurred, notice shall 
be given in the manner prescribed in Sections 107.2 and 107.3 to the person responsible 
for the violation and the owner of the premises upon which the violation has occurred as 
specified in the code. Notices for condemnation procedures shall also comply with 
Section 108.3." 

 
H. Subsection 109.5 Costs of emergency repairs: (page 6) 
 

Modify to read as follows:  "Costs incurred in the performance of emergency work are the 
responsibility of the owner of the premises where the unsafe structure is or was located. 
Such costs, however, may be initially paid by the Township. The Township Solicitor may 
institute the appropriate proceeding at law or in equity against the owner of the premises 
where the unsafe structure is or was located for the recovery of such costs." 

 
I. Subsection 111.1 Application for appeal: (page 6): 
 

Modify to read as follows: “111.1 Application for appeal.  Any person directly affected 
by a decision of the code official or by a notice or order issued under this code shall have 
the right to appeal such decision, notice, or order, provided that written application on a 
Township-approved form is filed with the Township within 30 days of the issuance of the 
decision, notice, or order being appealed from. An application for appeal shall be based 
on a claim that the true intent of this code or the rules legally adopted thereunder have 
been incorrectly interpreted, the provisions of this code do not fully apply, or the 
requirements of this code are adequately satisfied by other means." 

 
J. Subsection 111.2 Membership of board: (page 6): 



{00974497/} 4  

 
Modify to read as follows: "111.2 Jurisdiction over appeal. Any appeal filed under 
Subsection 111.1 shall be heard by the New Britain Township Building Code Board of 
Appeals, pursuant to and consistent with the practices and procedures established  for or 
by such Board and in accordance with the Pennsylvania Local Agency Law (2 Pa.C.S.A 
§101 et seq., as amended). The Board of Appeals shall have exclusive jurisdiction to hear 
and render final adjudications on such appeals." 

 
K. Subsections 111.3 through 111.6, inclusive (page 7), and subsection 111.8 (page 7) shall 

be deleted in their entireties and marked as "Reserved". 
 
L. Subsection 111.7 Court review: (page 7) 
 

Modify to read as follows: "Any person aggrieved by a Board of Appeals decision, 
including the Township,  may appeal this decision to the Court of Common Pleas. Such 
an appeal shall be filed within 30 days of the issuance of the decision. Within 30 days of 
the filing of an appeal, the Township and the owner and/or tenant of the premises directly 
involved in the appeal may intervene in the appeal as of course by filing a notice of 
intervention, accompanied by proof of service of the same upon each appellant or each 
appellant's counsel of record. All other intervention shall be governed by  the 
Pennsylvania Rules of Civil Procedure." 

 
M. Subsection 112.4 Failure to comply: (page 7) 
 

Replace the phrase "a fine of not less than [AMOUNT] dollars or more than [AMOUNT] 
dollars." with "a fine of not less than One Hundred Dollars ($100.00) or more than One 
Thousand  Dollars ($1,000.00). Each day the work continues  after the issuance of the 
stop work order shall constitute a separate finable offense. Such fines are in addition to 
any fines or penalties imposed pursuant to Section 106 concerning the violation(s) on the 
premises." 

 
N. Section 202 GENERAL DEFINITIONS: (page 9-10) 
 

The following definitions shall be inserted at the appropriate alphabetical spot into this 
Section and shall read as follows: 

 
"CODE OFFICIAL. The New Britain Township Code Enforcement Officer, Zoning 
Officer, or other person so designated by the New Britain Township Board of 
Supervisors."  
 
"JURISDICTION, THE. New Britain Township."  
 
"NOXIOUS WEEDS. Any noxious vegetation covered under and prohibited by the 
Noxious Weed Control Law (3 P.S. §255.1 et seq.), as amended, or by regulations of the 
Pennsylvania or United States Departments of Agriculture including, but not limited to, 
the following: 



{00974497/} 5  

 
• Cirsium arvense, commonly known as Canadian Thistle 

• Rosa miltiflora, commonly known as Multiflora Rose  

• Sorghum Halepense, commonly known as Johnson Grass 

• Pueraria lobata, commonly known as Kudzu Vine 

• Circium vulgare, commonly known as Bull or Spear Thistle 

• Carduus nutans, commonly known as Musk or Nodding Thistle 

• Sorghum bicolor, commonly known as Shattercane 

• Lythrum salicaria, commonly known as Purple Loosestrife (all cultivars) 

• Heracleum mantegazzianum, commonly known as Giant Hogweed 

• Galega officinalis, commonly known as Goatsrue 

• Amaranthus palmeri S. Watson, commonly known as palmer amaranth 

• Amaranthus rudis, commonly known as common waterhemp 

• Amaranthus tuberculatus, commonly known as tall waterhemp 

• Avena sterilis L, commonly known as animated oat 

• Cuscuta spp., except for native species, commonly known as dodder 

• Hydrilla verticillate Royle, commonly known as hydrilla 

• Oplismenus hirtellus, commonly known as Wavyleaf basketgrass 

• Orobanche spp, except for native species, commonly known as broomrape 

• Conium maculatum, commonly known as poison hemlock” 

and  
 

"WEEDS. All grasses, annual plants, and vegetation, other than trees or shrubs 
provided; however, this term shall not include cultivated flowers and gardens." 

 
O. Subsection 302.4 Weeds: (page 11) 

 
Modify first paragraph to read as follows: "All premises and exterior property within 200 
feet of any habitable structure or building shall be maintained free from weeds in excess 
of six (6) inches. This height restriction, however, does not apply to naturalized areas, 
riparian buffers, managed meadows, and other no-mow zones, as determined by the 
Township. All noxious weeds shall be prohibited throughout the entire premises and 
exterior property." 

 
P. Subsection 304.3 Premises Identification: (page 13) 
 



{00974497/} 6  

Modify to read as follows: "The Township shall have final authority as to the assignment 
of a street number/letter or address to each structure or premises. Each structure or 
premises to which a street number and/or letter has been assigned by the Township or if 
the structure or premises is located in a private community, to which a street or 
identification number/letter has been assigned by the community, shall have the 
appropriate number/letter displayed in a location and size as to be readily observed and 
readable from the public or private right of way that provides access to the structure or 
premises.   All street or identification numbers and letters shall be in Arabic characters 
with a minimum height of 6 inches and a minimum stroke width of ½ inch.   Structures 
that are set back more than 50 feet from the right of way providing access, or any distance 
where the number/letter cannot be readily seen from the right-of-way, shall have the 
assigned street or identification numbers/letters attached to a post or mailbox placed at the 
end of the driveway on the same side of the road as the structure is located. These 
numbers/letters shall be at least 4 inches in height with a minimum stroke width of ½ inch 
and shall be placed on both sides of the post or mailbox, at a minimum height of 3 feet so 
as numbers/letters can be seen by vehicles traveling from either direction. All street or 
identification numbers/letters shall be illuminated when possible and shall be colored in 
contrast with the background upon which the number/letter is placed. Nonresidential 
structures shall have the name of the tenant/occupant, along with the address/suite 
number, placed or painted on the rear entryway to the leasehold or area of the building 
occupied by said entity and shall meet the above height and width requirements of street 
numbers/letters.   
 
No street numbers shall be painted upon any public curbs, streets, signs, posts, or 
sidewalks without prior written approval of the Township. Any resident  wishing to 
display a street address upon the public curb line, may do so only with the permission of 
and in accordance with instructions provided by the Township Fire Marshal's office. All 
curb painting shall be in addition to the display of numbers listed above. Any person(s) 
soliciting for curb painting shall first obtain a Township soliciting permit, as well as prior 
approval of the Township Fire Marshal. Commercial contractors may be required to 
produce evidence of liability and worker's compensation insurance coverage. 

 
Q. Subsection 304.14 Insect screens: (page 13) 
 
Replace the phrase "During the period from [DATE] to [DATE]" with "Where appropriate, 
during the period from April 1 to October 31".  
 
R. Subsection 602.3 Heat supply: (page 21) 
 
Replace the phrase "during the period from [DATE] to [DATE]" with "during the period from 
October 1 to April 30". 
 
S. Subsection 602.4 Occupiable workspaces: (page 21) 
 
Replace the phrase "during the period from [DATE] to [DATE]" with "during the period from 
October 1 to April 30". 



{00974497/} 7  

ARTICLE III  SAVINGS CLAUSE 
 

Nothing in this Ordinance, or in the International Property Maintenance Code adopted 
hereby, shall be construed to affect any enforcement action, suit, or proceeding pending before 
any court or other legal body nor construed to affect any rights acquired, or liability incurred, or 
any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under any act or ordinance hereby repealed by 
this Ordinance. Furthermore, no just or legal right or remedy of any character shall be lost, 
impaired, or affected by the adoption of this Ordinance. 
 
ARTICLE IV  REPEALER 
 

New Britain Township Ordinance Nos. 2010-02-02 and 2019-04-02 are hereby repealed 
in their entirety. All other Township ordinances or parts of ordinances which are inconsistent 
herewith are hereby repealed but only to the extent of such conflict. 
 
ARTICLE V  SEVERABILITY 
 

If any sentence, clause, section, or part of this Ordinance is for any reason found to be 
unconstitutional, illegal or invalid, such unconstitutionality, illegality or invalidity shall not affect 
or impair any of the remaining provisions, sentences, clauses, sections or parts of this Ordinance. 
It is hereby declared as the intent of the Board of Supervisors that this Ordinance would have 
been adopted had such unconstitutional, illegal or invalid sentence, clause, section or part thereof 
not been included herein. 
 
 
ARTICLE VI  EFFECTIVE DATE 
 

This Ordinance shall become effective five (5) days after enactment. 
 

THE REMAINDER OF THIS PAGE IS INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK 



- 8 - {00974497/}  

NEW BRITAIN TOWNSHIP 
ORDINANCE NO. 2022- 

IPMC 
 
 

ENACTED AND ORDAINED this              day of                         , 2022, A.D., by the 
Board of Supervisors of New Britain Township in lawful session duly assembled. 
 
 

NEW BRITAIN TOWNSHIP  
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS 
 
 
________________________________ 
Gregory Hood, Chairman 
 
 
________________________________ 
William B. Jones, III, Vice Chair 
 
 
________________________________ 
Cynthia Jones 
 
 
________________________________ 
Mary Beth McCabe, Esq. 
 
 
________________________________ 
Stephanie Shortall, Esq. 



 

 

 
MOTION J 

 
 
 

 
 

TOWNSHIP OF NEW BRITAIN 
BUCKS COUNTY, PA 

 
BOARD MOTION 

 
 
 
Date: March 21, 2022 
 
 
I MOVE THAT: The Board authorize advertisement of Ordinance #2022‐04‐02, per the attachments. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Presented By: __________________________________ 
 
 
Seconded By: __________________________________ 

 



{00974510/}  

NEW BRITAIN TOWNSHIP 
Bucks County, Pennsylvania 

 
ORDINANCE #2022-04-02 

 
 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 5, PART 3 OF THE 
CODIFIED ORDINANCES OF NEW BRITAIN TOWNSHIP 
ADOPTING THE 2018 EDITION OF  THE  INTERNATIONAL 
FIRE CODE AS THE TOWNSHIP'S FIRE CODE REGULATING 
AND GOVERNING THE SAFEGUARDING OF LIFE AND 
PROPERTY FROM FIRE AND EXPLOSION HAZARDS, FROM 
THE STORAGE, HANDLING, AND USE OF HAZARDOUS 
SUBSTANCES, MATERIALS AND DEVICES, AND FROM 
CONDITIONS HAZARDOUS TO THE OCCUPANCY OF 
BUILDINGS AND PREMISES. 

 
 

WHEREAS, pursuant to Articles XV and XVIII, of the Second-Class Township Code, 
including but not limited to Sections 66505, 66506, 66517, 66527, 66529, and 66805, the New 
Britain Township has the ability to govern the conditions and maintenance of all property, 
buildings, and structures within the Township, and more specifically concerning fire and explosion 
prevention; and 
 

WHEREAS, the New Britain Township Board of Supervisors desires to establish minimum 
regulations for the governing and safeguarding of fire and explosion hazards. 
 

NOW, THEREFORE, it is hereby ENACTED and ORDAINED by the Board of 
Supervisors of New Britain Township, as follows: 
 
 
ARTICLE I Adoption and Codification of the Fire Code 
 

Section 5-301 of the Codified Ordinances of New Britain Township is hereby amended to 
read as follows: 
 
§5-301   Adoption of Standards. 
 
The 2018 International Fire Code, as published by the International Code Council, Inc., as 
amended, revised, and/or reprinted from time to time, is hereby adopted as the Fire Code of New 
Britain Township; for the control, regulation, and governing of the safeguarding of life and property 
from fire and explosion hazards, from conditions hazardous to life or property, and generally 
concerning the occupancy of buildings and premises within New Britain Township as herein 
provided; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said 
International Fire Code are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in 
this Part, with the additions,  insertions, deletions, and changes as prescribed below in this Part. 
 
ARTICLE II    Modification of International Property Maintenance Code Standards 



{00974510/} 2  

 
Section 5-302 of the Codified Ordinances of New Britain Township is hereby amended to 

read as follows: 
 
§5-302   Revisions to Standards. 
 
The following replacements,  insertions, changes, modifications, and deletions shall be made in the 
2015 International Property Maintenance Code, as amended, at the places hereinafter indicated: 
 
A. Subsection 101.1 Title. 
 

Replace "[NAME OF JURISDICTION]" with "New Britain Township". 
 
B. A new Subsection 101.6, Default Municipality, shall be added to the code and shall read as 

follows: 
 

101.6 Default Municipality. Whenever in this code a municipality or jurisdiction is 
mentioned and no name is given therefor, said reference to a municipality or jurisdiction 
shall be construed to mean New Britain Township, or where a state is mentioned, the same 
shall mean the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania; and where the Department of Fire 
Prevention is mentioned, the same shall mean the New Britain Township Fire Marshal. 

 
C. Subsection 102.3 Change of use or occupancy. 
 

Modify to read as follows: "Changes shall not be made in the use or occupancy of any 
structure that would place the structure in a different division of the same group or 
occupancy or in a different group of occupancies, unless such structure is  made  to comply 
with the requirements of this code and the provisions of the  Pennsylvania Uniform 
Construction Code, as adopted by New Britain Township ("PA UCC"). Subject to the 
approval of the fire code official, the use or occupancy of an existing structure shall be 
allowed to be changed  and the structure is allowed to be occupied for purposes in other 
groups without conforming to all of the requirements of this code and the PA UCC, for those 
groups, provided the new or proposed use is less hazardous,  based on life and fire risk, than 
the existing use. 

 
D. Subsection 102.4 Application of building code. 
 

Modify to read as follows: "The design and construction of new structures shall comply with 
the PA UCC, and any alterations, additions, changes in use or changes in structures required 
by this code, which are within the scope of the PA UCC, shall be made in accordance 
therewith. 

 
E. Subsection 102.5 Application of residential code. 
 

Modify to read as follows: "Where structures are designed and constructed in accordance 
with the International Residential Code, as adopted by the PA UCC, the provisions of this 
code shall apply as follows: 



{00974510/} 3  

 
1. Construction and design provisions of this code pertaining to the exterior of the 

structure shall apply including, but not limited to, premises identification, fire 
apparatus access and water supplies. Where interior or  exterior  systems or 
devices are installed, construction permits required by Section 105.7 of this code 
shall apply. 

 
2. Administrative, operational, and maintenance provisions of this code shall apply. 

 
F. Subsections 103.1 through 103.2, inclusive, shall be modified to read as follows: 
 

103.1 General.  The New Britain Township Fire Marshal or any authorized agent or 
employee thereof shall be designated as the fire code official for the purposes of this code. 

 
103.2 Appointment. The fire code official shall be appointed in accordance with the 
personnel procedures and policies of New Britain Township. 

 
G. Subsection 104.10 Fire Investigations. 
 

Modify to read as follows: "The fire code official shall have the authority to investigate the 
cause and circumstances of any fire, explosion, or other hazardous condition. Information 
that could  be related to trade secrets or processes shall not be made part of the public record 
except as directed by a court of law." 

 
H. Subsection 104.11 Authority at fires and other emergencies. 
 

Insert the following sentence at the end of this Subsection: "The fire code official is to direct 
the operation of the scene if no fire chief or fire officer from the fire department in charge of 
the fire district the emergency is located in is currently onsite." 

 
I. A third subparagraph shall be added to Subsection 105.1.2 Types of permits and shall read 

as follows: 
 

1. The fire code official shall determine when an operational permit or a 
construction permit is required. 

 
J. Section 109, Board of Appeals shall be deleted in its entity and replaced with the 

following: 
 

SECTION 109  
APPEALS 

 
109.1 General. Whenever the owner or builder of any building about to be or in the course 
of being erected, altered, repaired, used or occupied, or any other person takes exception to 
the decision of the fire code official in refusing to approve the manner of construction or the 
type of materials to be used in the erection, alteration, or repair of any building or structure, 
or to his/her decision as to the occupation or use of any building or structure, or as to its 



{00974510/} 4  

safety or compliance with the provisions of this code, such owner or builder or duly 
authorized agent may, within thirty (30) days after such decision, take an appeal to the Board 
of Appeals. Such appeal shall be in writing, state the decision of the fire code official and the 
reason for taking exception thereto, and shall be filed with the Township. The appeal shall 
be heard pursuant to and consistent with the practices and procedures established for or by 
the Board of Appeals and in accordance with the Pennsylvania Local Agency Law (2 
Pa.C.S.A §IOI et seq., as amended). The Board of Appeals shall have exclusive jurisdiction 
to hear and render final adjudications on such appeals. A written decision to affirm, modify, 
or reverse the decision of the code official shall be issued by the Code Appeals Board and 
duly recorded, with such decision being final. 

 
109.2 Limitations on authority.   An application for appeal shall be based on a claim that 
the true intent of this code or the rules legally adopted thereunder have been incorrectly 
interpreted, the provisions of this code do not fully apply or an equally  good or better form 
of construction is proposed. The Board of Appeals shall not have authority to waive 
requirements of this code. 

 
109.3 Court review. Any person aggrieved by a Board of Appeals decision, including the 
Township, may appeal this decision to the Court of Common Pleas. Such an appeal shall be 
filed within 30 days of the issuance of the decision.  Within 30 days of the filing of an 
appeal, the Township and the owner and/or tenant of the premises directly involved in the 
appeal may intervene in the appeal as of course by filing a notice of intervention, 
accompanied by proof of service of the same upon each appellant or each appellant's counsel 
of record. All other intervention shall be governed by the Pennsylvania Rules of Civil 
Procedure. 

 
K. Subsection 110.4 Violation penalties 
 

Modify to read as follows: "Any person who is found by a court of  competent jurisdiction, 
including but not limited to a Magisterial District Court or Court of Common Pleas, to have 
violated a provision of this code; to have failed to comply with any of the requirements of 
this code; to have erected, constructed, altered, repaired, or otherwise undertaken work on a 
building or structure in violation of the approved construction documents or any approved 
plan, permit, certificate, application for permit or certificate, or directive of the fire code 
official; or to have failed to comply with an order, directive, or notice of the code official 
concerning this code shall be liable for a civil penalty not less than Two Hundred Dollars 
($200.00) nor more than One Thousand Dollars ($1,000.00) for each violation, plus any and 
all costs incurred by the Township in bringing an action against such violation, including but 
not limited to consultant fees, attorney's fees, and expert witness fees. Each day that a 
violation continues shall be deemed a separate violation." 

 
L. Subsection 112 Failure to comply. 
 

Replace the phrase "a fine of not less than [AMOUNT] dollars or more than [AMOUNT] 
dollars." with "a fine of not less than One Hundred Dollars ($100.00) or more than One 
Thousand Dollars ($1,000.00). Each day the work continues after the issuance of the stop 
work order shall constitute a separate finable offense. Such fines are in addition to any fines 



{00974510/} 5  

or penalties imposed pursuant to Section 109 - Violations." 
 
M. Subsection 106 Schedule of permit fees. 
 

Modify to read as follows: "A fee for each permit shall be paid as required, in accordance 
with the schedule set by resolution of the Board of Supervisors of New Britain Township." 

 
N. Section 202, Definitions. The following definitions shall be amended to read as follows: 
 

FIRE CODE OFFICIAL. The Township Fire Marshal or Code Enforcement Officer charged 
with the administration and enforcement of this code, or a duly authorized representative. 

 
O. Section 202, Definitions. The following definitions shall be added to this Section and shall 

read as follows: 
 

BOARD OF APPEALS. The New Britain Township Building Code Board of Appeals 
created, organized, and operated in accordance with Chapter 5, Code Enforcement, of the 
Code of Ordinances of New Britain Township, as amended. 

 
TOWNSHIP. New Britain Township, Bucks County, Commonwealth of Pennsylvania. 

 
P. Section 307 Open Burning, Recreational Fires and Portable Outdoor Fireplaces shall 

be deleted in its entity and replaced with the following: 
 

SECTION 307 
OPEN BURNING, RECREATIONAL FIRES AND PORTABLE  

OUTDOOR FIREPLACES 
 

307.1 General.   No person shall kindle or maintain or authorize to be kindled or 
maintained any open burning in the Township, except for recreational fires and portable 
outdoor fireplaces.  Bonfires are specifically prohibited. 

 
307.2 Prohibited open burning. Any and all open burning shall be prohibited when 
atmospheric conditions or local circumstances make such fires hazardous in the opinion of 
the fire code official, such as periods of high winds, drought, or weather inversion. 
Moreover, the outdoor burning of any rubbish, garbage, or trash is strictly prohibited. 

 
307.3 Extinguishment authority. Where open burning creates or adds to a hazardous 
situation, is not allowed under this code, or a required permit for such burning has not been 
obtained, the fire code official is authorized to order the extinguishment of the open burning 
operation. 

 
307.4 Location. The location for open burning shall not be less than 25 feet from any 
property line or public right-of-way and shall comply with the following: 

 
307.4.1   Recreational fires. Recreational fires shall not be conducted within 25 feet 
of a structure or combustible material. Conditions that could cause a fire to spread 



{00974510/} 6  

within 25 feet of a structure shall be eliminated prior to ignition. 
 

307.4.2  Portable outdoor fireplaces. Portable outdoor fireplaces shall be used in 
accordance with the manufacturer's instructions and shall not be operated within 15 
feet of a structure or combustible material. Conditions that could cause a fire to 
spread within 15 feet of a structure shall be eliminated prior to ignition. 

 
307.5 Attendance. Open burning, recreational fires, and operating portable outdoor 
fireplaces shall be constantly attended until the fire is extinguished. A minimum of one 
portable fire extinguisher complying with Section 906 with a minimum 4-A rating or other 
approved on-site fire-extinguishing equipment, such as dirt, sand, water barrel, garden hose. 
or water truck, shall be available for immediate utilization. 

 
Q. Subsection 501.3 Construction documents. 
 

Replace the term "fire department" on line five with the term ''fire code official". 
 
R. Subsection 503.6 Security gates. 
 

Replace the term "fire chief' on lines two and three with the term ''fire code official". 
 
S. Subsection 903.2 Where required. 
 

Modify to read as follows: "An automatic fire suppression system shall be installed in all 
newly constructed or reconstructed buildings and structures, or additions to existing 
buildings and structures in all of the following Building Use Groups:   A-1, A-2, A-3, A- 4, 
B, E, F-1, F-2, 1-1, 1-2, I-3, 1-4, M, R-1, R-2, R-3, R-4, S-1, and S-2. Use Group H shall 
meet Section 904.5 of this code and as per Table 903.2.11.6. All buildings and structures 
shall be I 00 percent covered and designed to meet N.F.P.A. 13, 2013 Edition, or as 
amended. Existing non-sprinklered buildings and structures shall meet Sections 903.2.l 
through 903.2.12 of this code, as amended, when their Building Use Group changes. 

 
T. Subsection 903.2.3 Group E. 
 

Modify entire subsection and exception to read as follows: "An automatic fire suppression 
system shall be provided throughout all buildings." 

 
U. Subsection 905.3.1 Building height. 
 

Modify entire subsection and exception to read as follows: "Class III stand pipe systems 
shall be installed throughout buildings where the floor level of the highest story is located 
more than 8 feet above the lowest level of the fire department vehicle access or where the 
floor level of the lowest story is located more than 8 feet below the highest level of the fire 
department vehicle access." 

 
V. Subsection 1103.7  Fire Alarm Systems shall be replaced with the following: 
 



{00974510/} 7  

1103.7 Fire alarm systems.   An approved fire alarm system, along with an automatic fire 
detection system, shall be required in all existing buildings with occupancies in Use Groups 
A, B, E, F, H, I M, S, R-1, and R-2. Smoke detectors are required in all egress, access 
corridors, hallways, stairways, lobbies, vestibules, and telephone rooms. All other areas of 
the building, including attic areas, shall be equipped with rate of rise heat detectors. All 
detectors in the system are to be interlocked and coupled to a means of producing a visual 
and audible alarm as per Subsection 907.6 of this code. All fire alarm systems shall be 
installed per N.F.P.A. 72, as listed in Chapter 80 of this code. All fire alarm systems shall be 
monitored as per Section 907.6 of this code. 

 
Exceptions: 
 

1. Sprinklered Buildings.   Occupancies in existing buildings and structures without an 
existing, previously approved fire alarm system shall install an approved fire alarm 
system in accordance with Sections 1103.7.1 through 1103.7.7 and provide occupant 
notification in accordance with Section 907.5 unless other requirements are provided 
by other sections of this code.  
 

2. Existing Non-Sprinklered Buildings under 5,000 square feet of total floor area 
(includes all floors and basement areas within the building or structure). Buildings 
less than 5,000 square feet shall have 100 volt interconnected smoke alarms or heat 
detectors spaced no more than 30 feet on center and at least one in each room. All 
detectors shall have battery backup. An exterior horn/strobe shall be connected to the 
smoke detectors.  

 
3. Existing Buildings with a fire alarm system and sprinkler system may meet 

Exception No. 1 above, only after the fire alarm system has been installed for at least 
five years.  

 
4. Existing Non-Sprinklered R-1 and R-2 Use Groups. An automatic fire detection 

system is not required in existing buildings that do not have interior corridors serving 
guest rooms and apartments as their means of egress. These Building Use Groups 
will be required to meet Sections 1103.5 through 1103.7.6 of this code. 

 
W. Subsection 5704.2.9.6.1 Locations where above-ground tanks are prohibited. 
 

Modify to read as follows: "Storage of Class I and II liquids in above-ground tanks outside 
of buildings is prohibited throughout the Township, except within the I-Industrial and the 
IO-Industrial Office Zoning Districts." 

 
X. Subsection 5706.2.4.4 Locations where above-ground tanks are prohibited. 
 

Modify to read as follows: "Storage of Class I and II liquids in above-ground tanks is 
prohibited throughout the Township, except within the I-Industrial and the IO-Industrial 
Office." 

 
Y. Subsection 5806.2 Limitations. 



{00974510/} 8  

 
Modify to read as follows: "Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers 
outside of buildings is prohibited throughout the Township, except within the I-Industrial 
and the IO-Industrial Office Zoning Districts." 

 
Z. Subsection 6104.2 Maximum capacity within established limits. 
 

Modify to read as follows: "Within the limits established by law restricting the storage of 
liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily populated or congested areas, the 
aggregate capacity of any one installation shall not exceed a water capacity of 2,000 gallons, 
except within the I-Industrial and the IO-Industrial Office Zoning Districts of the 
Township." 

 
Exception: In particular installations, this capacity limit shall be determined by the 
fire code official, after consideration of special features such as topographical 
conditions, nature of occupancy, and proximity to buildings, capacity of proposed 
LP- gas containers, degree of fire protection to be provided and capabilities of the 
local fire department. 

 
 
ARTICLE III    SAVINGS CLAUSE 
 

Nothing in this Ordinance, or in the International Fire Code adopted hereby, shall be 
construed to affect any enforcement action, suit, or proceeding pending before any court or other 
legal  body nor construed  to affect any rights acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes 
of action acquired or existing, under any act or ordinance hereby repealed by this Ordinance. 
Furthermore, no just or legal right or remedy of any character shall be lost, impaired, or affected by 
the adoption of this Ordinance. 
 
 
ARTICLE IV   REPEALER 
 

New Britain Township Ordinance Nos. 2010-02-01 and 2019-04-01 are hereby repealed in 
their entirety. All other Township ordinances or parts of ordinances which are inconsistent herewith 
are hereby repealed but only to the extent of such conflict. 
 
 
ARTICLE V   SEVERABILITY 
 

If any sentence, clause, section, or part of this Ordinance is for any reason found to be 
unconstitutional, illegal or invalid, such unconstitutionality, illegality or invalidity  shall  not affect 
or impair any of the remaining provisions, sentences, clauses, sections or parts of this Ordinance. It 
is hereby declared as the intent of the Board of Supervisors that this Ordinance would have been 
adopted had such unconstitutional, illegal or invalid sentence, clause, section or part thereof not 
been included herein. 
 
 



{00974510/} 9  

ARTICLE VI   EFFECTIVE DATE 
 

Ordinance shall become effective five (5) days after enactment. 
 

THE REMAINDER OF THIS PAGE IS INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK 
  



{00974510/} 10  

 
NEW BRITAIN TOWNSHIP  

ORDINANCE NO. 2022- 
Fire Code 

 
 
ENACTED AND ORDAINED this          day of                  , 2022, A.D., by the Board of 
Supervisors of New Britain Township in lawful session duly assembled. 
 
 

NEW BRITAIN TOWNSHIP  
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS 
 
 
________________________________ 
Gregory Hood, Chairman 
 
 
________________________________ 
William B. Jones, Vice Chair 
 
 
________________________________ 
Cynthia Jones 
 
 
________________________________ 
Mary Beth McCabe, Esq. 
 
 
________________________________ 
Stephanie Shortall, Esq. 

 



 

 

 
MOTION K 

 
 
 

 
 

TOWNSHIP OF NEW BRITAIN 
BUCKS COUNTY, PA 

 
BOARD MOTION 

 
 
 
Date: March 21, 2022 
 
 
I MOVE THAT: The Board adopt Resolution 2022‐08: Police Department Records Dissolution, per the 
attachment. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Presented By: __________________________________ 
 
 
Seconded By: __________________________________ 

 



RESOLUTION NO. 2022-08 
 

New Britain Township 
Bucks County, PA 

 
A Resolution Declaring the Township of New Britain’s Intent to 

Dispose of Records as Set Forth in the Municipal Records Manual 
Approved on June 18, 2012, and in Accordance with Resolution 

1999-20 
 

WHEREAS, by virtue of Resolution No. 1999-20, adopted June 28, 1999, New 
Britain Township declared its intent to follow the schedules and procedures for the 
disposition of records as set forth in the Municipal Records Manual approved on July 
16, 1993, as amended; and, 
 

WHEREAS, in accordance with Act 428 of 1968, each individual act of 
disposition shall be approved by resolution of the governing body of the municipality. 
 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Board of Supervisors of New 
Britain Township, Bucks County, Pennsylvania, in accordance with the above cited 
Municipal Records Manual, hereby authorizes the disposition of the following public 
records:   
 

 Citations older than 3 years old and not part of case file. 
 

DULY ADOPTED BY THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF NEW BRITAIN 
TOWNSHIP, BUCKS COUNTY, PENNSYLVANIA, the lawful session duly 
assembled this 21st day of March, A.D. 2022. 
 
 
NEW BRITAIN TOWNSHIP BOARD OF SUPERVISORS 
 
 
_____________________________  Attest: _________________________ 
Gregory T. Hood, Chair     Matt West, Township Manager 

_____________________________ 
William B. Jones, Member 
            
_____________________________ 
Cynthia M. Jones, Member 
 
_____________________________ 
MaryBeth McCabe, Esq., Member 
 
_____________________________   
Stephanie Shortall, Member 



 

 

 
MOTION L 

 
 
 

 
 

TOWNSHIP OF NEW BRITAIN 
BUCKS COUNTY, PA 

 
BOARD MOTION 

 
 
 
Date: March 21, 2022 
 
 
I MOVE THAT: The Board authorize Kind Like Joey Foundation 5k Special Event Fundraiser at North 
Branch Park; and authorize the use of food trucks with a valid certificate of insurance and health 
inspection certificate, per the attachments. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Presented By: __________________________________ 
 
 
Seconded By: __________________________________ 

 



 

TO:  Matt West, Township Manager 

FROM: Chelle Clancy, Parks & Recreation Coordinator 

DATE: March 16, 2022 

RE: Kind Like Joey Foundation 5k Special Event Fundraiser 

 

 
On October 13, 2018, Dan, and Marina Edwards, tragically lost their son, Joey 
Edwards, in an accident in Warrington, PA. Joey was a New Britain Township resident 
and The Kind Like Joey Foundation was founded by his family and friends to keep his 
memory alive.  The mission of the Kind Like Joey Foundation is to spread kindness. 
 
The Kind Like Joey Foundation would like to host a 5K Fundraiser at North Branch Park 
on Sunday, May 1, 2022, from 6:30 am to 1:30 pm.  This will be the third time the Kind 
Like Joey Foundation has held this event.  They are expecting approximately 250 to 300 
attendees for the event, which will host a DJ, vendors, and food trucks.  
 
The food trucks will be set up in the parking spots along the main drive in between the 
pavilions and soccer fields to keep them off the grass and each truck will be equipped 
with their own generator. Vendors will either be placed in the same area or on the 
basketball courts. All attendees will be directed to park in the back lot and the front 
parking lot once the back lot is filled. The park driveway will be closed during the race, 
as this is part of the route. 
 
The Kind Like Joey Foundation has coordinated with local sports leagues to ensure 
North Branch Park is available on May 1st. 
 
Staff Recommendation: 
 
Upon review, the New Britain Township Police, Public Works, Zoning, and Park & 
Recreation Departments are requesting the following added requirements and fees: 
  

 $125.00 service fee for added cleaning of portable toilets after the event.   
Additional trash cans will be in the vicinity of the food trucks and pavilion where 
the DJ will be located.  

 
New Britain Township Staff and the Parks & Recreation Board recommend the Board 
authorize the use of North Branch Park on Sunday, May 1, 2022, from 6:30AM until 
1:30PM by the Kind Like Joey Foundation for a Special Event 5K Fundraiser; and 
authorize the use of food trucks with a valid certificate of insurance and health 
inspection certificate. 



NEW  BRITAIN  TOWNSHIP
207 ParkAvenue  - Chalfont,  PA 18914 a Telephone:  (215) 822-1391

PARK  FIELD  & PAVILION  USE

PERMIT  APPLICATION

Please  note:

1. This application  is a request  for  field or pavilion  use  and  does  not
auarantee  reservation  of  fields

I TOWNSHIP USE ONLY
IPermit#:

')  Dleiaceh  inrli  irla  +hei  aai;le  y{  -!ill  ;xa;iiiaa  IJ-511% 4k44  iiiiiia'iix&  44  Lx  zx:@*J iReceived:  r;Ua 7-o)!i2', K(7."  777
&-a I II;i  I @ Ilt#  IJIJ   kA @l;; I;;g g j €;€j  @  %J € @ @ € @ ju  j V e tj  uag8  1 € jd  t j/Vd  € j t kg  LJe  eF  J €d  € €e(J

when  fields  are  closed- iPayment:   '-'
'2  T119   rye_+ype_  v  s i e_+  kx  eb  s s k:44xj  t  iiii:&k  !ii  ii  S € ffl  ffi  ..-  -  -  J  J  --  -  - Check #: 
d.  I Galll  I UJlel81llu51  Ale  5uulllllleu  Wllgl  ILIII  namej  aOOreSS,

municinalitv_  nhrinp  numhs_r  and  aha  nf  parh  nl*vor  IReceipt #: 1.
- - - ss- - - - -+ - 7   s - $ )  5 7  a a  a a %I- a s  a g a  %l a six a a %4 €0€ H  %# %f I %* 141111 tlll4  J  li  @ s I

Date of Application: a/ 'l  f2C)2 2
qppiicant:"ktnal,t'!'e_.,}oec-(&nda-aonhomephone:

Contact(ifOrganization): 'pitYt)a(Cl N'tet/eS-Sua CellPhone:  2i5-'82-'g-'t2-t T
=J  -

Address: 31Lt Sirt,5Kill b,c,Hi-k;pa iXqitl Email: n'\eveSaa'tlzz
Estimated Attendance: 2S0  -  3 00  Number  of  Townshio  Residents:  rc>rsy  2c)0

I  l-  -

SELECT THE FACILITY  REQUESTED BELOW:

NORTH BRANCH PARK: 'ir  5l<  'Race.
[dSoccer/Football Field #='l [Softball  Field #1 0  Baseball  Field #4  []  Pavilion  #1

[;occer  Field #2 [oftball  Field #2 0  Baseball Field #5  0  Pavilion  #2
[occer  Field #3 ]Softball  Field #3  0  Baseball  Field #6
ISrSoccer Field #4
[occer  Field  #5

doccer  Field #6

WEST  BRANCH  PARK:

0  T-Ball Field #1 0  Multi-Purpose  Field
€  T-Ball  Field  #2

HIGHLANDS  PARK:

[]  Open  Field  []  Pavilion

Day(s)

Field(s) Date(s) Time(s)

ffav@r@w@m@ras  rrom:5/7fNo:5)_f/')  rromro:  l:3Chm
-  = $  -  -NleI  a -  a4-j  -

0S0M0T0W0TH0F0S  From: To: From:  To:

[]S[]M0TOW0TH0FOS  From: To: From:  To:  '

0SOM0T0WOTH0FOS  From: To: From: To:

0SOM0T0W0TH0F0S  From: To: From:  To:

ADDITIONAL  REQUESTS:

iafgtTh*-tSaSutOn (2p'c verdos-,J- bl4bk5
"The undersigned party, a duly elected or authorized individual or the above group or organization, requests the reservation  of Township
owned park facilities and certifies that the organization has reviewed, and agrees at all times to abide by, the Park Rules and Regulations

established by Nse.lwgnBarittauinreTOowf nAsphpipl.l.Cant: M  Date: a , .  , A.
%l  "  - I I I '  - /  -



Permit Rules & Regulations:

To assume all risks in connection with the use ofthefacilities requested and to herebyrelease, absolve,indemnify and hold
harmlesstheTownshipofnewBritainanditsemployeesfromanyandallclaimsandallcosts,  damages,legalfees,and
anyotherexpensesreasonablyincurredwhichariseoutoftheauthorizationtousetheTacilitiesoTtheTownship. We
understand this request andwe agree to be legally bound hereby.

B. Thattheresponsibilityforcarryingappropriatemedicalplans,includinghospitalization,lieswithourteam/organizationand/
or participants.

C. ToadheretotheNewBritainTownshipRulesandRegulationsTorParksandPlaygrounds.

D.  Toagreetoinspectallplayingsurfacespriortoandduringallperiodsofuseandtoimmediatelydiscontinueuseifatany
timewe considerthefacilitiesunsaFeorinappropriateforuse,andtonotifytheTownshipinwritingwithintwenty-fourhours
of any hazardous  conditions  which exist.

E. Toagreetoberesponsiblefortheproperdisposalofalllitterand/ordebrisgeneratedbyouractivity.

F. Toagreetonotapplyanyherbicides,insecticidesorotherchemicalsuponthelands,norpostanysigns,withoutprior
Townshipapprovalinwriting. AllmarkingoTTieldsshallbemadewithonlypaintapprovedforsuchpurposes(soccer)or
athleticlimeintendedforsuchpurpose{ballfields). Theconfigurationoffieldsmustnotbealteredinanyway.

G. Toagreethatanissuedpermittakesprecedenceoveranon-scheduledpractice/gamefortheuseoffield.  Alldisputeson
field usage, iftheycannot be resolved by the parties in conflict, will be settled by the Township,

H. ToagreethatitisthesoleresponsibilityoTourteam/organizationtoprotectandinsurethesafetyofallparticipantsand
spectators atanyand all activities conducted on townshipowned property.

To agree that our team/organization shall be in full compliance with Pennsylvania's Child Protective Services

Law and that all of our clubs/team/organization's employees, volunteers, board members, directors, agents
and contractors shall haveobtained and will maintain all the clearances necessaryto supervise and interact
with children in compliance with Pennsylvania Law, including but not limited to: the Pennsylvania Child Abuse

History Clearance, the Pennsylvania State Police Criminal Record Check and the Federal  Bureau  of

Investigation Criminal Background  Check.

J. TheTownshipreservestherighttocloseanyfacilityduetoweatherorotherconditionsdeemednecessary,

K. TheTownshipisnotresponsibleforanyitemsand/orcontentsstoredbyourteam/organizationinanystorageunits(boxes,
sheds, etc.) located on township property. *ifour team/organization stores any items in any storage unit, ourteam/
organization will supply a duplicate key and/or combination to the township for any locks used on these units.

By signing below, I (We) agree the Rules and Regulations as stated above:

Signature

Date

Revised  - October  20, 2021



DATE (MM/00/YYYY)

02/16/2022

THIS  CERTIFICATE  IS ISSUED  AS  A MATTER  OF  INFORMATION  ONLY  AND  CONFERS  NO  RIGHTS  UPON  THE  CERTIFICATE  HOLDER.  THIS

CERTIFICATE  DOES  NOT  AFFIRMATIVELY  OR  NEGATIVELY  AMEND,  EXTEND  OR  ALTER  THE  COVERAGE  AFFORDED  BY  THE  POLICIES

BELOW,  THIS  CERTIFICATE  OF INSURANCE  DOES  NOT  CONSTITUTE  A  CONTRACT  BETWEEN  THE  ISSUING  INSURER(S),  AUTHORIZED

REPRESENTATIVE  OR  PRODUCER,  AND  THE  CERTIFICATE  HOLDER.

IMPORTANT:  If  the  certificate  holder  is an  ADDITIONAL  INSURED,  the  policy(ies)  must  have  ADDITIONAL  INSURED  provisions  or  be endorsed.

If SUBROGATION  IS WAIVED,  subject  to  the  terms  and  conditions  of  the  policy,  certain  policies  may  require  an  endorsement.  A  statement  on

this  certificate  does  not  confer  rights  to  the  certificate  holder  in lieu  of  suct  endorsement(s).

PRODUCER

Williams  and Stazzone  Insurance

6549  N Wickham  Road

unit  4 01

Melbourne  FL32940

coNTAcT Stefani  SolazzoNAME:

7:g,':,ext): (800)868-1235 17A,ho): (321)868-2003
AE-DDMA,'EssL, ssolazzo@wsins.com

INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #

INSURERA:  United States Liability Insurance Company 25895

INSURED

Kind  Like  Joey  Foundation

324  Stonyhill  Dr

Chalfont  PA  18914

INSURER B :

INSURER C :

INSURER D :

INSURER E :

INSURER F :

COVERAGES

THIS  IS TO CERTIFY  THAT  THE POLICIES  OF INSURANCE  LISTED  BELOW  HAVE  BEEN  ISSUED  TO THE INSURED  NAMED  ABOVE  FOR  THE POLICY  PERIOD

INDICATED.  NOTWITHSTANDING  ANY  REQUIREMENT,  TERM  OR CONDITION  OF ANY  CONTRACT  OR OTHER  DOCUMENT  WITH  RESPECT  TO WHICH  THIS

CERTIFICATE  MAY BE ISSUED  OR MAY PERTAIN,  THE  INSURANCE  AFFORDED  BY THE POLICIES  DESCRIBED  HEREIN  IS SUBJECTTO  ALL  THE  TERMS,

EXCLUSIONS  AND  CONDITIONS  OF SUCH  Pa  _IC1E:3. LIMITS  SHOWN  MAY HAVE BEEN  REDUC  ED BY PAID CLAIMS.

INSR
LTR TYPE OF INSURANCE

ADDL
INSD

SUBR
WVD POLICY NUMBER

POLICY EFF
(MM/DDffYYY)

POLICY EXP
(MM/DD/YYYY) LIMITS

_vMcE,RiCxlAsl::N;RAaxLLIAoBclLclTYus
EACH OCCtJRRENCE $ 1,000,000
DAMAGE TO RENT bl)
PREMISES (Ea occurrence) $ Excluded
MED EXP (Any one person) $ Excluded

A It NBP'1 558884B 09/24/2021 09/24/2022 PERSONAL &AOV INJIJRY $ 1,000,000
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER

_WOpoTHciEcRy @ 'jg8; 0 LOC
GENERAL AGGREGATE $ 2,000,000
PRODLICTS-COMP/OP  AGG $ 2,000,000

$

AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY

=  ANY ALITO

 OWNED rl  SCHEDULED
AuTOS ONLY LJ  AuTOS

a  HIRED I  NON-OWNED-  ALITOS ONLY L_J  ALITOS ONLY

COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT
(Ea accident) $

BODILY INJURY (Per person) $

BODILY INJLIRY (Per accident) $

PROPERT/  DAMAGE
(Per accident) $

$

UMBRELLA  IIAB

EXCESS LIAB

OCCUR

CLAIMS-MADE

EACH OCCIJRRENCE $

AGGREGATE $

DED I I RETENTI)N  $ $
WOP.KERS COMPENSATION

AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY  Y / N

=i==3'='x'c"u'g7:ECuT"E @(Mandatory  in NH)
If yes, descnbe under
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below

N/A

ISTAUTE I I gR"-
E.L. EACH ACCDENT $

E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE $

E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT $

DES(:RIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional  Remarks SChOdule, mad be aiaChOd if more space iS required)

Certifciate  Holder  is listed  as "Additional  Insured".

CERTIFICATE  HOLDER

CERTIFICATE  NUMBER:  CL2221649202 REVISION  NUMBER:

CANCELLATION

New  Britain  Township

207  Park  Ave

Chalfont  PA  18914

I

SHOULD  ANY  OF THE  ABOVE  DESCRIBED  POLICIES  BE CANCELLED  BEFORE

THE EXPIRATION  DATE  THEREOF,  NOTICE  WILL  BE DELIVERED  IN

ACCORDANCE  WITH  THE  POLICY  PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE ,J  %
@ 1988-2015  ACORD  CORPORATION.  All  rights  reserved.

ACORD  25 (2016/03) The  ACORD  name  and  logo  are  registered  marks  of  ACORD



)==("yd Li!:e



Township  of  New  Britain

Office  of  Code  Enforcement

Febuary  2022

PERMITS  ISStTED

ZONING

BUILDING  INSPECTION

United  electrical

69

12

110

13

OCCUPANCY  INSPECTIONS

RE-INSPECTION

COMMF,RCIAL  FIRE  INSPECTIONS 1

FIRE  CALLS

CHALFONT

DOYLESTOWN

DUBLm

HILLTOWN

10

2

2

l No  Report

15



Chalfont  Fire Company

Chiefs  Report  - February  2022

Total  # oflncidents  - :

Types  of  Calls

1. Fire

2. Rescue  and  Medical  assist

3.Hazardous  Conditions

4.Service  calls

5. Good  Intent  Call

6. Alarm  System  Calls

7. Special  Incident

8.SevereWeather  0

Total  Staff  Hours  for  Calls 191:30:00

Alarms  per  Municipality

Chalfont  Boro

Doylestown  Boro

Dublin  Boro

Ambler  Boro

New  Britain  Boro

Montgomery  Twp

New  Britain  Twp

Warrington  Twp

8

1

1

1

2

3

12

1

Training  and  Maintenance  Drills  3

Total  training  hours  321  Total  Available  Points

TOTAL  STAFF HRS FIRES AND  TRAINING

32

512:30:00



Chalfont  Chemical  Fire  Company
Clialfont.  PA

This  report  was  generated  on 3/2/2022  2:14:27  PM

Incidents  per  Zone  for  Date  Range

Sta t Daa.e 02,'0'/2022 l End Date: 02/28/2022

l! 'N
>
Mi

Q
q.
I
4ia=
Ul
'l',_!)!

['

11
)gi
14

(
;

g
;,
p;X.
4!A

,>:.
7
!fl

ij

!
}Ill. .1
m
:u
:-i
'i:O't

'K"'%:a)
lri0='!/i! 

}hll)7,:$fl%fa'?,
n-l,, ,}. ::il
:X(l'7!II:ial!'a71l<"'li"ii

i 1470,"'-
i41_()ail

L!;,','III
0,? o;l(Qi
[si., -lii  '
r)ii.f+.'.ff

P, I %}11 ffi € k )7 J4  (+]i  I ,  - ,_ ,,  % %

CIDENTiiYPE!-r_

1:'<"7"4L''!o:"'i'l:'ai""":":';:{,l,'!a"'A"il'::'ea"';qaay:y"'a"'-'._-'.:'!.,=',=ffi..-='-..l::.,,.f!.,?=:ul:t.,%,Ji'IJi5.':"aA#PA@A'i5,6:",;-4'al:a
::zF_,hJ!x tL"L"')lt*f-?_gJ)__'f>i!'t";a!'.(J::

jZO_NE_:27 ;lfont  Boro
r-""""
I

i 2022-1802
i 745f'Alarmsystemactivati-on-,nofir-e-'-'-

unintentional l--8-:_io-;_iz-o:_;_----1"------205-E -B-ut7e7Ave---'1
I iii  _______._.__I

2022-2011 1l1  - Building  fire i----'0:i:05/202'2-j 29 PatriotDr-'-'--l
2022-2109

745  - Alarm  system  activation,  no fire  -

unintentional l 02/07/2022
I -'-  - " 50 Hamilton  St II 34/74

2022-2284
745  - Alarm  system  activation,  no fire  - 

unintentional

a---------'-"'

i 02/1 0/2022
r-'-'-'-"---"-----'-'-
, 27 Hellberg  Ave
I

34/74

2022-2375 113  - Cooking  fire,  confined  to container  'i 02/1 2/2022 ' 58 Westview  Ave

2022-2525

'  -----'-YI

745  - Alarm  system  activation,  no fire  -

unintentional

<-'--'--'-"  -'--

02/1  5/2022 I 47 E Butler  Ave

2022-3034
745  - Alarm  system  activation,  no fire  -

unintentional
02/23/2022 ' 56 E Butler  Ave 34/74

2022-3127 600  - Good  intent  call,  offier 02/24/2022 ' 210  W Hamilton  St 34/74

Total  # Incidents  for  27: 8

ZONE:  28  - Doylestown  Boro

2022-2607..... .1 iiiiiiiiiii  600 - Goo9--inten-tJall,other---f-"-'-:-F_-6/,7022 I " 22_______9WSta____te St ""-""I 34/74
Total  # Incidents  for  28: I

L'--"""----'--------'------'---'-'--'--  ""'-'  ---

IZONE: 3"1 - Dublin Boro

7" ..2o;_2'-2944 I 112  - Fires  in structure  other  than  in a

building
I 02/21/2022 210 N Dublin Pk I

Total  # Incidents  for  31 : 1

ZONE:  43  - Ambler  Borough

2022-1887 1571 - Cover assignment, standby, moveup ! 02/03/2022 245  E Race  St

Total  # Incidents  for  43:

34/74

1

ZONE:  47  - New  Britian  Boro

2022-2520  111 - Building  fire

20223016  745 - Alarm system activation, no fire -
unintentional

02/1  4/2022

02/22/2022

212  N Tamenend  Ave

376  W Butler  Ave

Total  # Incidents  for  47:

34/74

34/74

2

IZONE: 47-MT - Montgomery Twp. ___________ _______ _ _ _
2022-1780 "I 11 - Building  fire  'I  _____ozioqi:>_____opp.___I 180-F:lly'D-r---'--' '--'---34/7-4  ----'--

2022-2339 600  - Good  intent  call,  other  ,I 02/11/2022 l'-'-115 Garden Golf Blvd-'- 34/74

2022-2793 111 - Building  fire  j: 02/1  8/2'0-27-
I

:'---171C7mmer-ce  Dr  """"'

'rotal  # Incidents  for  47-MT 3

Only  REVIEWED  incidents  included.  Archived  Zones  cannot  be unarchived.

emergencyreporting.com
Doc Id: 380
Page # S of 2



l=4\4jm
I 2022-1856

t;;',y=a,I'-':'laN,'CIDEN'at'7YPE"'

-1,1' ,r,41,_1_, ,a _r,i' :s, %:' 4, lt' l,.v: t 7 ;i _- 1%,_ *aa _10; , _ .  _ (IT, ._iai- ___-=  _  L  -x  i _.-_i_-  .-'  _  -i.  __-r-'_a  -__i '

745  - Alarm  system  activation,  no fire  -

unintentional !___€4:'2"f'a-2J(2
,"  :;' co:6xiigH  '-,,.:;,, ,:
I '  a - . a .i  .  i  aii.  .-  '  .'l'..

%.%'i-.  1.  %..  -  ..  I , .1 - i,;. ,  :'.; ... . , l :,. . l :  . ..'

1500  HorizonDr

l"  -"-"'
1_ 2022-al955 iiiii 311 - Med'ical  assist,  assist  EMS  crew  __][62/04/202,? 33 Citadel  Cr l-"'-341?-4 -"""'-"""'l
7' po:zp-pffia'z "' 445 - Arcing, shorted el-e7trica-Iequ-ip-m-ennJ6:_-;i-i-iio:_p  J-'-'-'-'l'13Dolly L-n---T_J":---'--'-'34/74""'-'-'--'-j

I I

j 2(i22-23Ei9  '

: 2022-2401
I

600 - Good intent call, other I
---'--'------'---'--'-'----'----1
735  - Alarm  sounded  due  to  '

msyasllFeumnction I

1--------02-/1,)-/-202!2
l_  _  _.._  _ -_  _  __-.-  __
I
I

' 02/12/2022
I

i 100 LarkspurCt '-"
i"'  -'-  '-  '-'-  -'----"  "'  -

' 4365  County  Line  Rd

:'---"-'-230-W-B7tler Ave--""-
I

r

' 2022-2521 74.5. - A_la_rJn._s_uy_nsln___tentlffi0n_fafl'ffln-,_j_f:r_; __TflT-0-2-/1\/'2-0-2-2 '--
2022-2796 "'73!4"'I-Alarm""'smyasltfe7m,s,7rn-j_f'J_u_e___to---1f-"'-"-02'/1 -972022-'-"'-'-"

I

r -'--'-  "---
I
i 4365  County  Line  Rd

2022-2854 745 - Alarm system act-ivati;n-,-no7ire - lunintentional  ,
02/20/2022

I

830 Long  Meadow  Dr
I

2022-2980 745 - Ala:-m-s-uy7stlnetmen'atllc0tniv-a-alt!Y-n-,'-n-o-fir-e J-'-I
__..__J

l-------'-'--'-  ---

: 02/22/2022 f"-"-"'-"l-8-0--N-e-w-B-ritain Blvd

2022-3164 7:!!5 '"'-Ala'T*--s'ystem-:;Ytiva-tio-n',-no-fire- --l
unintentgonal.____________  __)

' 02/25/2022 1'-'-'--310 W Boulder  Dr
I

2022-3341 311 - Medical assist-,"'as""'sis't-E-M-S-'crew-""102/28/2022 T-8C-o-unt-ry-View'Ln"" f " i
 34/74  '

Total  # Incidents  for  48: 12

4-:75-WarringtonTwp.  -'-"-'-""--------  '
l 2022-3252 ! 600 - Good intent call, other -"J 02/26/2022 l 21 91d New Rd I 34/74"""'

TOT  AL  # INCIDENTS:

Total  # Incidents  for  75:

29

1

Only  REVIEWED  incidents  included.  Archived  Zones  cannot  be unarchived.

emergencyreporting.com
Doc Id: 380
Page # 2 oT 2



DOYLESTOWNFRA

Incidents  For  New  Britian  Township

Alarm  Date  Between  {02/01/2022}  And {02/28/2022}

Incident-Exp@

22  -  00  02069-O00

22-0002074-000

22  -  00  02448-O00

Alm  Date

02  /06  /2022

02  /06/2022

02  /13  /2022

Total  Incident  Count  3

Alm  Time

12  :50  : 00

14  : 00  : 00

17  :50  : 00

Location

150  KING  RD

1910  SWAMP  RD  /BC  Housing

1038  FERRY  RD

Incident  Type

743  Smoke  detector  activation,

743  Smoke  detector  activation,

736  CO detector  activation  due

03/04/2022  14:15 Page 1



Dublin  Volunteer  Fire  Company

Month: February  2022

FIRE  CALLS  ANSWERED OTHER  PERTINENT  INFORMATION

Accident  with  Fire

ASSiStS

Engine Time  in Servia-e a " -"'- "l 1 Hrs 17  Min

Field Total  Man  Hours 84 Hrs  23 Min

Full  Company Average  Call  Length 38 Min

Ladder

' Rescue

Squad 1

Tanker Total  Personnel 107

Air  Medical  Evaucation Average  Personnel  per  Call 6

Alarm  System 4

Auto  Extrication

Auto  Response 4 Borough/T  ownship

Barn

Brush Bedminister  Township 7

Building Dublin  Borough 5

Chimney I East  Rockhill  Township

CO Alarm Hilltown  Township 3

Control  Burn New  Britain  Township 2

Cover/Up Plumstead %wnship
Cover/Up  ASSiSt Haycock  Township

Domestic  Rescue Perkasie  Borough 1

Dwelling I Nockamixon  Township

Elevator Tinicum  Township

Fumes  outside

Fumes  in a Dwelling

Fuel  Spill

Hazardous  Material

Investigation

Med-A-Vac

Rubish

Shed 1

Stand  by Accident I

Transformer 1

Wires 3

Wires  in Dwelling '1

Wrong  Dispatch

Total  Number  of  Calls 18 Total  Numbe  of  Calls "18



New  Britain  Township
207 Park Avenue

Chalfont,  PA 18914

Phone: (215)  822-1391

Fax: (215)  822-6051

n bt@ newbritaintownship.org

Permit  Number

2021-11687-Bl

2022-11977-B2

2022-11978-B2

2022-11990-B2

2022-12005-B2

2022-12012-Bl

2022-12041-Bl

2022-12042-Bl

2022-12049-B2

2021-11687-E2

2021-11886-E3

2022-11977-E3

2022-11978-E3

2022-11990-E3

2022-12009-El

2022-12012-E2

2022-12042-E2

2022-12049-E3

2021-11687-P4

2022-11978-P5

Issued  Date

02/18/2022

02/07/2022

02/0  1/2022

02/07  /2022

02/23/2022

02/09/2022

02/11/2022

02/11/2022

02/28/2022

02/18/2022

02/22/2022

02/07  /2022

02/0  1/2022

02/07  /2022

02/0  1/2022

02/09/2022

02/11/2022

02/28/2022

02/18/2022

02/0  1/2022

Site  Address

619  N LIMEKILN  PIKE

165  UPPER  CHURCH  ROAD

300  MILL  RIDGE  DRIVE

115  CURLEY  MILL  ROAD

4275  COUNTY  LINE  ROAD

24  HELENS  LANE

1820  N LIMEKILN  PIKE

106  STONE  CREEK  LANE

15  PASTURE  LANE

619  N LIMEKILN  PIKE

100  0LD  LIMEKILN  ROAD

165  UPPER  CHURCH  ROAD

300  MILL  RIDGE  DRIVE

115  CURLEY  MILL  ROAD

925  UPPER  STUMP  ROAD

24  HELENS  LANE

106  STONE  CREEK  LANE

15  PASTURE  LANE

619  N LIMEKILN  PIKE

300  MILL  RIDGE  DRIVE

2022-12005-P4 02/23/2022 4275  COUNTY  LINE  ROAD

3/9/2022

Permit  Tvoe

Building

Building

Building

Building

Building

Building

Building

Building

Building

Electrical

Electrical

Electrical

Electrical

Electrical

Electrical

Electrical

Electrical

Electrical

Plumbing

Plumbing

Plumbing

Permit  List

Application  Type

Residential

Residential

Residential

Residential

Commercial

Residential

Residential

Residential

Residential

Commercial

Residential

Residential

Residential

Residential

Residential

Residential

Residential

Residential

Status

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Commercial Approved

Page 1 of 5



New  Britain  Township
207 Park Avenue

Chalfont,  PA 18914

Phone: (215)  822-1391

Fax: (215)  822-6051

nbt@newbritaintownship.org

Permit  Number

2022-12012-P3

2022-12042-P3

2022-12049-P5

2022-12069-Pi

2022-12073-Pi

2022-12007-ROI

2022-12017-ROI

2022-12020-ROI

2022-12021-ROI

2022-12022-ROI

2022-12023-ROI

2022-12024-ROI

2022-12025-ROI

2022-12026-ROI

2022-12027-ROI

2022-12028-ROI

2022-12029-ROI

2022-12030-ROI

2022-12051-ROI

2022-12052-ROI

Issued  Date

02/09/2022

02/11/2022

02/28/2022

02/22/2022

02/23/2022

02/02/2022

02/17/2022

02/09/2022

02/09/2022

02/09/2022

02/09/2022

02/09/2022

02/09/2022

02/09/2022

02/09/2022

02/09/2022

02/09/2022

02/09/2022

02/17/2022

02/17/2022

Site  Address

24  HELENS  LANE

106  STONE  CREEK  LANE

15  PASTURE  LANE

134  DOLLY  CIRCLE

114  HAMPSHIRE  DRIVE

216  SURREY  ROAD

WALDEN  WAY

SELLERSVILLE  ROAD

SELLERSVILLE  ROAD

SELLERSVILLE  ROAD

WALNUT  STREET

FARBER  DRIVE

WALTER  ROAD

BOULDER  DRIVE

BROOKE  LANE

GLEN  DRIVE

M ARSH  ALL  CIRCLE

CRESCENT  DRIVE

CEDAR  HILL  ROAD

NEW  BRITAIN  BLVD

2022-12053-ROI 02/17/2022 TOWNSHIP  LINE  ROAD

3/9/2022

Permit  List

Permit  Type

Plumbing

Plumbing

Plumbing

Plumbing

Plumbing

Road  Occupancy

Road  Occupancy

Road  Occupancy

Road  Occupancy

Road  Occupancy

Road  Occupancy

Road  Occupancy

Road  Occupancy

Road  Occupancy

Road  Occupancy

Road  Occupancy

Road  Occupancy

Road  Occupancy

Road  Occupancy

Road  Occupancy

Application  Type

Residential

Residential

Residential

Residential

Commercial

Commercial

Commercial

Commercial

Commercial

Commercial

Commercial

Commercial

Commercial

Commercial

Commercial

Commercial

Commercial

Commercial

Commercial

Status

Approved

Approved

Approved

Closed

Closed

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Road  Occupancy Commercial Approved

Page 2 of 5



New  Britain  Township
207 Park Avenue

Chalfont,  PA 18914

Phone: (215)  822-1391

Fax: (215)  822-6051

nbt@newbritaintownship.org

Permit  Number

2022-12054-ROI

2022-12055-ROI

2022-12056-ROI

2022-12057-ROI

2022-12058-ROI

2022-12059-ROI

2022-12060-ROI

2022-12080-Sl

2021-11328-UO7

2022-11961-UOI

2022-11976-UOI

2022-119C16-UOI

2022-12008-UOI

2022-12048-UOI

2022-12061-UOI

2021-11406-Zl

2021-11938-Zl

2022-11991-Zl

2022-12011-Zl

2022-12018-Zl

Issued  Date

02/17/2022

02/17/2022

02/17/2022

02/17/2022

02/17/2022

02/17/2022

02/17/2022

02/28/2022

02/28/2022

02/02/2022

02/09/2022

02/28/2022

02/14/2022

02/28/2022

02/16/2022

02/23/2022

02/15/2022

02/17/2022

02/14/2022

02/07  /2022

Site  Address

SCHOOLHOUSE  ROAD

MAPLE  AVENUE

DOVER  DRIVE

VILLAGE  WAY

HAMLET  DRIVE

TREWIGTOWN  ROAD

TREWIGTOWN  ROAD

525  W BUTLER  AVENUE

63 COWBELL  LANE

804  LONGMEADOW  COURT

810  LONGMEADOW  COURT

137  CALLOWHILL  ROAD

138  WALTER  ROAD

26  PASTURE  LANE

97  PALACE  COURT

121  KING  ROAD

112  BELLE  VIEW  WAY

991  NEW  GALENA  ROAD

359  TOWNSHIP  LINE  ROAD

9 PATRICIA  LANE

2022-12031-Zl 02/25/2022 147  CHEESE  FACTORY  ROAD

3/9/2022

Permit  List

Permit  Type

Road  Occupancy

Road  Occupancy

Road  Occupancy

Road  Occupancy

Road  Occupancy

Road  Occupancy

Road  Occupancy

Sign

Use  & Occupancy

Use  & Occupancy

Use  & Occupancy

Use  & Occupancy

Use  & Occupancy

Use  & Occupancy

Use  & Occupancy

Zoning

Zoning

Zoning

Zoning

Zoning

Application  Type

Commercial

Commercial

Commercial

Commercial

Commercial

Commercial

Commercial

Residential

Residential

Residential

Residential

Residential

Residential

Residential

Residential

Residential

Residential

Residential

Residential

Status

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Closed

Approved

Closed

Closed

Closed

Approved

Closed

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Zoning Residential Approved

Page 3 of 5



New  Britain  Township
207 Park Avenue

Chalfont,  PA 18914

Phone: (215)  822-1391

Fax: (215)  822-6051

nbt@  newbritaintownship.org

Permit  Number

2022-12032-Zl

2022-12036-Zl

2022-12043-Zl

2022-12044-Zl

2022-12049-Zl

2022-12066-Zl

2022-12075-Zl

2022-11978-F6

2022-12005-F6

2022-12005-F7

2022-12049-F6

2021-11687-M3

2022-11978-M4

2022-12010-Ml

2022-12013-Ml

2022-12014-Ml

2022-12040-Ml

2022-12042-M4

2022-12049-M4

2022-12063-Ml

Issued  Date

02/07  /2022

02/14/2022

02/17/2022

02/14/2022

02/15/2022

02/28/2022

02/25/2022

02/0  1/2022

02/23/2022

02/23/2022

02/28/2022

02/18/2022

02/0  1/2022

02/02/2022

02/09/2022

02/09/2022

02/11/2022

02/1  1/2022

02/28/2022

02/16/2022

Site  Address

5 NAOMI  LANE

241  W BUTLER  AVENUE

223  FOREST  PARK  DRIVE

108  TEAL  DRIVE

15  PASTURE  LANE

101  WHITE  TAIL  COURT

123  NORTH  LANE

300  MILL  RIDGE  DRIVE

4275  COUNTY  LINE  ROAD

4275  COUNTY  LINE  ROAD

15  PASTURE  LANE

619  N LIMEKILN  PIKE

300  MILL  RIDGE  DRIVE

39 FAIR  ISLE  CIRCLE

213  MOHEGAN  STREET

123  SHADY  HILL  DRIVE

147  BRITTANY  DRIVE

106  STONE  CREEK  LANE

15  PASTURE  LANE

97  PALACE  COURT

2022-12064-Ml 02/16/2022 241  PRINCE  WILLIAM  WAY

3/9/2022

Permit  Type

Zoning

Zoning

Zoning

Zoning

Zoning

Zoning

Zoning

Fire

Fire

Fire

Fire

Mechanical

Mechanical

Mechanical

Mechanical

Mechanical

Mechanical

Mechanical

Mechanical

Mechanical

Mechanical

Permit  List

Application  Type

Residential

Commercial

Residential

Commercial

Commercial

Residential

Residential

Residential

Residential

Residential

Residential

Residential

Residential

Status

Approved

Approved

Denied

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Closed

Residential Approved

Page 4 of 5



New  Britain  Township
207 Park Avenue

Chalfont,  PA 18914

Phone: (215)  822-1391

Fax: (215)  822-6051

nbt@newbritaintownship.org

Permit  Number

2022-12070-Ml

2022-12077-Ml

2022-12078-Ml

2022-12079-Ml

2022-12005-5

Issued  Date

02/22/2022

02/25/2022

02/28/2022

02/28/2022

02/23/2022

Site  Address

141  TARTAN  TERRACE

116  CIRCLE  DRIVE

34  MAPLE  AVENUE

562  MALLARD  DRIVE

4275  COUNTY  LINE  ROAD

Permit  List

Permit  Tvoe

Mechanical

Mechanical

Mechanical

Mechanical

Accessibility  Permit

Application  Type

Residential

Residential

Residential

Residential

Commercial

Status

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

Approved

3/9/2022 Page 5 of 5



November 2015 

New Britain Township Police 

Department 

       Monthly Report  -   

       Police Department - Page 1 of 3 

Current Goals and Objectives: 

 

February 2022 

Result of Goals & Objectives: 

Objective 1: Leadership Team Professional Development 
   
    Objective 2: Update and standardize policy and procedure 
 

Objective 3: Implement Body Worn Cameras and In Car Camera Systems 
 

Objective 4: Reduce traffic accidents by 10% compared to 2021  
 
Objective 5: Increase community engagement activity and collaboration with social service agencies  

Objective 1: Promotional process to promote one officer to corporal scheduled for May 3rd. Geographic policing operating 
principle developed. 
 
Objective 2: Onboarding packet for Aspirant Consulting completed. 
 
Objective 3:  Researching on site or cloud storage options.  
 
Objective 4:  Collected data on traffic accidents over past three years to identify focus areas. 
 
Objective 5:  Ongoing review of reports and recommendations for referrals. 
 

Significant Events: 

Completed 
 New hire Daniel Sacks. 
 DUI Roving Details scheduled throughout February. 
 
Upcoming 
 ICAT training 
 Additional DUI Roving Details scheduled throughout March. 
 Implementation of 2022 Goals and Objectives. 
 Receipt and implementation of new uniforms. 
 Drug Take Back Day scheduled for April 30th. 
 Coffee with a cop, location to be determined. 
 



       Monthly Report  -   

       Police Department - Page 2 of 3 

February  2022 

New Britain Township Police 

Department 

PERFORMANCE STATISTICS 

PART 1 CRIMES 
28 DAY 

2022 2021 % Change 

Murder 0 0 NA 

Rape 0 1 -100% 

Robbery 0 0 NA 

Aggravated Assault 0 0 NA 

Burglary 1 0 NA 

Theft 5 2 150% 

Auto Theft 0 0 NA 

Arson 0 0 NA 

TOTALS 6 3 100% 

PART 2 CRIMES 
28 DAY 

2022 2021 % Change 

Assaults (non-aggravated)\Harassment 1 2 -50% 

Fraud 2 3 -33.33% 

Vandalism/Criminal Mischief 2 0 NA 

Disorderly Conduct 0 0 NA 

Drug Violations 0 0 NA 

Driving Under the Influence 0 2 -100% 

Public Drunkenness 3 0 NA 

Weapons Offenses 0 0 NA 

All Other Offenses (Except Traffic) 0 0 NA 

TOTALS 8 7 14.28% 

MOTOR VEHICLE  
ACCIDENTS 

28 DAY 

2022 2021 % Change 

Total Accidents 15 18 -16.66% 

Injury Accidents 4 0 NA 

Fatal Accidents 0 0 NA 

Property Accidents 2 2 0% 



       Monthly Report  -   

       Police Department - Page 3 of 3 

February 2021 

New Britain Township Police 

Department 

PART 1 CRIMES 
YTD 

2022 2021 % Change 

Murder 0 0 NA 

Rape 0 2 -100% 

Robbery 0 0 NA 

Aggravated Assault 0 0 NA 

Burglary 1 0 NA 

Theft 8 5 60% 

Auto Theft 0 0 NA 

Arson 0 0 NA 

TOTALS 9 7 28.57% 

PART 2 CRIMES 
YTD 

2022 2021 % Change 

Assaults (non-aggravated)/Harassment 5 1 400% 

Fraud 6 8 -25% 

Vandalism/Criminal Mischief 2 1 100% 

Disorderly Conduct 0 4 NA 

Drug Violations 0 1 NA 

Driving Under the Influence 0 3 NA 

Public Drunkenness 3 0 NA 

Weapons Offenses 0 0 NA 

All Other Offenses (Except Traffic) 0 0 NA 

TOTALS 16 18 -11.11% 

PERFORMANCE STATISTICS 

MOTOR VEHICLE  
ACCIDENTS 

YTD 

2022 2021 % Change 

Total Accidents 27 31 -12.90% 

Injury Accidents 6 1 500% 

Fatal Accidents 0 0 NA 

Property Accidents 5 2 150% 



 

Departmental Report 

Year:    2022 

Month:   February 

 

Drainage:    All drainage systems were checked on an as needed basis. 

Patching:  We continued cold patching township roadways for potholes 

and will monitor until permanent repairs can be made. 

Street Signs:  We replaced numerous safe‐hits throughout the township, 

they are used to designate drainage pipes or edges of 

roadway. 

Twp. Property:  We constructed the first dugout roof on field #5, and 

removed/ demolished the second dugout roof on field #5. 

Construction of second roof will be completed when weather 

permits. 

Snow and Ice:  We had three (3) minor snow/ ice events in February and used 

approximately 300 tons of salt. 

Equip. Maint:  All dump trucks and snow removal equipment were checked 

over after every use, washed and repairs were made as 

necessary. All mowers were serviced for upcoming season. 

Brushing:  We cutup and removed several down trees along the 

Neshaminy Greenway Trail down off Bristol Rd. 

 

 

HOURS 

Drainage:        47  Hrs. 

Patching:        94  Hrs. 

Street Signs:      19  Hrs. 

Snow and Ice:      41  Hrs. 

Equipment Maint:     177.5 Hrs. 

Township Property Maint:  219.5 Hrs. 

Brushing:        31.5  Hrs. 

Other:        82.5  Hrs. 



 

NEW BRITAIN TOWNSHIP 1 

  

March 2022 

Next P&R Meeting(s) April 19, 2022, 7PM 

Welcome New P&R 
Advisory Board 
Appointees 

• Renee Steskal to fill remaining term of Cynthia Jones expiring 
December 31, 2023. Cynthia Jones is now Board of Supervisors 
liaison. 

• Margaret Briggs, Kathleen Dutill, and Brooke Newborn appointed 
to Advisory Board as non-voting members, one-year term. 

Easter Egg Hunt April 2, 2022 (Rain date April 9) at NB Park:   

• Photos with Easter Bunny 9:30AM. 

• Egg Hunt 10AM sharp. 

• NB Food Pantry will be collecting non-perishable donations. 

Sports Fields • Opening Day for NB Park Fields:  Sunday, March 20, 2022. 

• Park & Rec Board in review of Sports Fields application form. 

North Branch Park • Awaiting delivery/install date of Lyons Recreation playground 

equipment.  Supply issues causing extreme production delays.  

• Dugout roof repairs:  Shingles and paint application.  

• Downed Trees:  Chip & cleanup from Winter Storms.  

• Park Use Permit in review with staff for Kind Like Joey 5K 
Marathon.  Event Date: Sunday, May 1, 2022. 

• Field 5 renovations scheduled completion Spring 2022. 

Veterans Park Recommendation for Free Little Library in review with Parks & 

Recreation Advisory Board. 

P&R Staff Training via 
DVHIT Library 

2022 Training for P&R Staff completed in March, 2022: 

• The Nuts and Bolts of Playground Maintenance  

• Inspecting Playgrounds for Hazards 

• The Young Supervisor's Guide to Supervision  

 

Parks & Recreation Monthly Report 


	2022_0321_NBT_BOS_BusMtg_Agenda
	03_B1_ServiceAward_Michie
	03_B2_ServiceAward_Maguire
	03_B3_ServiceAward_Walsh
	06_A1_Motion_MeetingMinutes
	06_B1_Motion_Schedule of bills
	06_B2_BillsList
	2022_0321_BillsList
	BillsList_SignPg
	Blank Page


	06_C1_Motion_ConsentAgenda
	06_C2_2022_0321_ConsentAgenda
	06_C3_RecordPlan_4373CountyLineRd_26-005-002-004
	06_D1_Motion_Res2022-06_BudgetAmendment_FundTransfers
	06_D2_Memo_Res2022-06_BudgetAmendment_FundTransfer
	06_D3_Res2022-06_BudgetAmendment_FundTransfer
	06_E1_Motion_Res2022-07_409WButlerAve
	06_E2_Res2022-07_409WButlerAve
	NBT. Butler Avenue-Approval Resolution (00974867x9D8D2)
	NBT-409 W. Butler Resolution w-exhibits

	06_F1_Motion_BccMaterialsBidAward
	06_F2_Memo_StoneBidAward
	06_F3_2022_StoneBid_TabulationSummary
	Sheet1

	06_G1_Motion_SaleOfProperty_2011FordCrownVictoria
	06_G2_Memo_2011CrownVic_41579530
	06_G3_AuctionReport_2011CrownVic_41579530_Redacted
	06_H1_Motion_NbtEngagementLtr_2020SingleAudit
	06_H2_NbtEngagementLtr_2020SingleAudit
	06_I1_Motion_AuthorizeAdvertise_Ord2022-04-01
	06_I2_Ord2022-04-01
	06_J1_Motion_AuthorizeAdvertise_Ord2022-04-02
	06_J2_Ord2022-04-02
	06_K1_Motion_Res2022-08_PwRecordsDissolution
	06_K2_Res2022-08_PdRecordsDissolution
	06_L1_Motion_KindLikeJoeyFoundation5KAuthorization
	06_L2_Memo_KindLikeJoey5KAuthorization
	06_L3_ParkUseApp_KindLikeJoey5K
	07_B_DepartmentalReports
	2022_02_CodeReport
	2022_02_PdReport
	2022_02_PwReport
	2022_03_PrReport


	undefined_2: 


